20

SUN NEWSPAPERS

Thursday, Nov. 21, 2019

PUBLIC NOTICES

714.530.7622 ¢ legals@sunnews.org

Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
OF BULK SALE
NOTICE TO CRDITORS
OF TRANSFER
IMPROVEMENTS
PERTAINING TO THE
REALTY
(SECS. 6101-6107
u.c.C.)

No. 096-111-41
Notice is hereby given to
creditors having an in-
terest in certain items of
Improvements Pertaining
to the Realty that a trans-
fer is about to be made
only to those certain items
of Improvements Pertain-
ing to the Realty (fixtures
and equipment) and loc-
ated ONLY at the busi-
ness address set forth
herein. This transaction is
NOT concerned with any
other address at which
said Transferor might be
located. Said list of Im-
provements Pertaining to
the Realty is on file in the
office of the Transferee
and any and all inquiries
should be made at said of-
fice, telephone number is:
OFFICE: (949) 724-3159,
person of contact Carly

Beard
The name and business
address of the intended
transferor is:
99 Cent Outlet and Thien

Dinh Hoang

7126 Westminster
Boulevard Westminster,
CA 92683

The location in California
of the chief executive of-
fice or principal business
office of the intended
transferor is (SAME AS
ABOVE)

The name and business
address of the intended
transferee is:

Meta Housing Corporation
11150 W Olympic Blvd.
#620

Los Angeles, CA 90064
The property pertinent
hereto is described in gen-
eral as Improvements Per-
taining to the Realty of that
certain business known

December 10, 2019, which
is the business day before
the consummation date
specified above. This
transfer of Improvements
Pertaining to the Realty is
subject to California Uni-
form Commercial Code
Section 6106.

This transfer of only those
certain items of Improve-
ments Pertaining to the
Realty is not a normal bulk
sale of the business. Said
transfer does not include
the transfer of any li-
censes, stock in trade,
goodwill, or any other
transfer relating to the
business, other than the
purchase of those certain
items of Improvements

as: Pertaining to the Realty,
99 Cent outlet and Thien which are considered
Dinh Hoang items through the pur-

The said transfer of the
items of Improvements
Pertaining to the Realty in-
tended to be consum-
mated, and all claims may
be filed, at the office of:
Commonwealth Land Title
Company

Attention: Carly Braed
4100 Newport Beach, CA
92660

This transaction shall
close on or after Decem-
ber 11, 2019, and the last
day for filing claims by any
creditor of said items of
Improvements Pertaining
to the Realty, shall be

chase of the real property
by the Transferee.
Date: October 17, 2019
Meta Housing Corporation
/S/ By: Chris Maffris
Name: Chris Maffris
Its: Executive Vice Presid-
ent
11/21/19
CNS-3314647#
HUNTINGTON HAR-
BOUR SUN-JOURNAL
Huntington Harbour
Sun-Journal
11/21/2019 - 89839

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

DRE#: 01237349

OF BULK SALE
NOTICE TO CRDITORS
OF TRANSFER
IMPROVEMENTS
PERTAININGTO THE
REALTY
(SECS. 6101-6107

u.c.C

No. 096-111-41
Notice is hereby given to
creditors having an in-
terest in certain items of
Improvements Pertaining
to the Realty that a trans-
fer is about to be made
only to those certain items
of Improvements Pertain-
ing to the Realty (fixtures
and equipment) and loc-
ated ONLY at the busi-
ness address set forth
herein. This transaction is
NOT concerned with any
other address at which
said Transferor might be
located. Said list of Im-
provements Pertaining to
the Realty is on file in the
office of the Transferee
and any and all inquiries
should be made at said of-
fice, telephone number is:
OFFICE: (949) 724-3159,
person of contact Carly
Beard
The name and business
address of the intended
transferor is:

Modern Home Furnitures
and Tan Manh Tran

7122 Westminster
Boulevard, Suite B&D
Westminster, CA 92683

AMERICAN

BEACHSIDE = BROKERS
Voted Best Of Seal Beach 2018

Duplex Investment Opportunity
253 17th Street, Seal Beach

(2) 2 Bedroom, 1.5 Ba, Two Story Apts
Freshly Painted & Stucco’d Bldg Exterior

Front Patio & Xtra Large Upstairs Deck
Double Paned Windows/Laminate Floors

Attached 2 Car Garage & Laundry Area
$1,315,000. Call 562 599 9509 to View.

American Beachside Brokers/Villa Real Estate

The location in California
of the chief executive of-
fice or principal business
office of the intended
transferor is (SAME AS
ABOVE)

The name and business
address of the intended
transferee is:

Meta Housing Corporation
11150 W Olympic Blvd.
#620

Los Angeles, CA 90064
The property pertinent
hereto is described in gen-
eral as Improvements Per-
taining to the Realty of that
certain business known
as:

Modern Home Furnitures
and Tran Manh Tran
The said transfer of the
items of Improvements
Pertaining to the Realty in-
tended to be consum-
mated, and all claims may
be filed, at the office of:
Commonwealth Land Title
Company

Attention: Carly Braed
4100 Newport Beach, CA
92660

This transaction shall
close on or after Decem-
ber11, 2019, and the last
day for filing claims by any
creditor of said items of
Improvements Pertaining
to the Realty, shall be
December 10, 2019, which
is the business day before
the consummation date
specified above. This

CLASSIFIEDS

Classified space and copy deadline is Tuesday at 12:00 p.m.

562-430-7555

WANTED TO BUY

AUTOMOBILES WANTED

YOUR AD
COULD BE HERE
Call 562-430-7555

Cars, Trucks,Motorcycles.
We buy all kinds of quality
late model vehicles or

non-running klunkers. Bad

Seal Beach 5 Star Zillow Broker

MOVE IN SPECIAL!!
1623 Seal Way B, Seal Beach
Remodeled Condo, Bay Views
2 Spacious Balconies w/Views
2 Bedrooms, 1 1/2 Bathrooms
Small Pet Welcome (15 Ibs or less).
New Kitchen, Stv, Dishwasher
Tandem Garage,W/D Hookups
Rent: $3395. Available Now
800 992 8283 x 1001

Remodeled Hunt. Beach House

Custom Dining Area, Gas Fireplace

tags,bad paperwork or
smog issues. We buy
all...fair prices.

Paid CASH! We pick up.
714-273-9931 or
562-684-0901

19742 ShoreCliff Lane, Hunt.Bch 81648

3 Bedrms, 2.5 Baths, 1726 SqFt
New Kitchen w/Granite Counters

New Flooring & Window Coverings
Front Patio Deck/Private Rear Yard
2 Car Garage with W/D Hookups
Rent: $ 3850. Available Now.
800 992 8283 x 1002

FURNISHED Ocean Front Apt
1319 Seal Way, A, Seal Beach
Ocean Front and Remodeled
3 Bedrms, 1 Bath, Tile Floors
Granite Kitchen w/Appliances
Dining Area, Lrg Living Room
2 Pkg Spaces, Comm Laundry
Rent: $4000. Available Now
800 992 8283 x 1003

Furnished Seal Beach House

324 17th Street, Seal Beach
2 Story, 3 Bedrm, 2 1/2 Baths
1750 sqft, Livingroom/Dining
Wash/Dryer, Front/Side Patios
Gas Fireplace, 2 Pkg Spaces,
All Utilities, Cable & Wifi Paid
Rent: $4500. Avail Nov 16th
800992 8283 x 1004

Naples Portofino Condo
5400 E The Toledo Walk #609
2 Bd, 2 Ba Condo, 1118 Sq Ft

6th Floor, Pergo/Tile Flooring
Remodel Kitchen, Lrg Balcony

Wash/Dryer, Cedar Closets,

Naples/Ocean View, Pkg Spc
Rent: $3150. Available Now.

800 992 8283 x 1005

To View Our Current Listings, Go To:
LivingByTheBeach.com

Melissa Gomez
Broker - Owner - Notary - GRI

562-599-9509

16360 Pacific Coast Hwy #208 Sunset Beach
Vacation Homes ¢ Sales & Rentals

Fully Furnished Beach House
413 Ocean Ave, Seal Beach
3 Bedrooms 1 1/2 Bathrooms
Fireplace,Front & Rear Patios
1 Car Garage, Laundry Room
All Utilities, Cable & Wifi Paid
Steps to the Ocean & Main St
Rent: $4000. Avail Now
800 992 8283 x 1006

FOR RENT

Seal Beach Ocean Ave
Steps To Beach
3br/2bth
1500 Sf * Luxury Condo
2 Car Garage * A/C
W/D In Unit

$4000 Monthly
Call For Appt.
740-381-7400

HELP WANTED
RENTALS » PERSONALS
LOOKING FOR SELLING OR BUYING
YARD SALES ¢ ETC.

CALL US FOR ALL YOUR
ADVERTISING NEEDS

562-430-7555

SERVICES

transfer of Improvements
Pertaining to the Realty is
subject to California Uni-
form Commercial Code
Section 6106.
This transfer of only those
certain items of Improve-
ments Pertaining to the
Realty is not a normal bulk
sale of the business. Said
transfer does not include
the transfer of any li-
censes, stock in trade,
goodwill, or any other
transfer relating to the
business, other than the
purchase of those certain
items of Improvements
Pertaining to the Realty,
which are considered
items through the pur-
chase of the real property
by the Transferee.
Date: October 17, 2019
Meta Housing Corporation
/S/ By: Chris Maffris
Name: Chris Maffris
Its: Executive Vice Presid-
ent
11/21/19
CNS-3314645#
HUNTINGTON HAR-
BOUR SUN-JOURNAL
Huntington Harbour
Sun-Journal
11/21/2019 - 89841

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
OF

BULK SALE
NOTICE TO CRDITORS
OF TRANSFER

===

IMPROVEMENTS
PERTAINING TO THE
REALTY
(SECS. 6101-6107
u.c.C.)

No. 096-111-41
Notice is hereby given to
creditors having an in-
terest in certain items of
Improvements Pertaining
to the Realty that a trans-
fer is about to be made
only to those certain items
of Improvements Pertain-
ing to the Realty (fixtures
and equipment) and loc-
ated ONLY at the busi-
ness address set forth
herein. This transaction is
NOT concerned with any
other address at which
said Transferor might be
located. Said list of Im-
provements Pertaining to
the Realty is on file in the
office of the Transferee
and any and all inquiries
should be made at said of-
fice, telephone number is:
OFFICE: (949) 724-3159,
person of contact Carly

Beard
The name and business
address of the intended
transferor is:

CC Builders & Design and
Cam Vi Vuong

7140 Westminster
Boulevard Westminster,
CA 92683

The location in California
of the chief executive of-
fice or principal business

REALTY

ROPERTY MANAGEMENT

-PROPERTY OWNERS-
We need rentals!!
Let us help you fill your vacancies.
We get the job DONE!

RENTALS

1109 % - Seal Way UPPER
FURNISHED
2 Bedrooms, 1 Bath
ALL furnished plus small items in
remodeled unit! Stove & refrig, D/W
and W/D plus Plasma TV.
Bedrooms upstairs one w/ Ocean
views. 1 carport parking space,
close to Main Street and building
on the boardwalk.
No Pets / No Smoking
Rent: $3,300 Avail: NOW

1007 Ocean Ave #5 w/ Ocean View
1 Bedroom, 1 Bath
On a third floor (stairs only) having
Ocean view. NEW floors, new stove/
refrig, new paint,
lots of kitchen cupboard space.
Light and bright, large open shared
courtyard with BBQ.
1 car garage w/opener.
No Pets / No Smoking
Rent: $2,200 Avail: NOW

201 11th Street #2 w/ Covered Balcony
1 Bedroom, 1 Bath
On a second floor with a covered
balcony area accessed from living
room or bedroom. Newer wood
plank looking floors, new paint.
Offers stove/refrig, d/w, includes
1 covered carport parking space,
shared laundry on site.
No Pets / No Smoking
Rent: $1,950 Avail: NOW

1401 Seal Way - Lower FRONT Unit
2 Bedrooms, 1 Bath

Live on the sand, new pai
new carpetingoe
i ther )

Si i 'good cupboard
spacg, shared free laundry and patio
area to enjoy, 1 car garage.

No Pets / No Smoking
Rent: $3,200 Avail: NOW

Best of Seal
Beach Winner
4 Years
Running!

CALL HEIDI GUIOL
Office (562) 596-6600 // Cell (562) 343-4622
321 Main Street // www.BaytownRealty.com



Thursday, Nov. 21, 2019

SUN NEWSPAPERS

21

PUBLIC NOTICES

714.530.7622 ¢ legals@sunnews.org

Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB

office of the intended
transferor is (SAME AS
ABOVE)
The name and business
address of the intended
transferee is:
Meta Housing Corporation
11150 W Olympic Blvd.
#620
Los Angeles, CA 90064
The property pertinent
hereto is described in gen-
eral as Improvements Per-
taining to the Realty of that
certain business known
as:
CC Builders & Design and
Cam Vi Vuong
The said transfer of the
items of Improvements
Pertaining to the Realty in-
tended to be consum-
mated, and all claims may
be filed, at the office of:
Commonwealth Land Title
Company
Attention: Carly Braed
4100 Newport Beach, CA
92660
This transaction shall
close on or after Decem-
ber 11, 2019, and the last
day for filing claims by any
creditor of said items of
Improvements Pertaining
to the Realty, shall be
December 10, 2019, which
is the business day before
the consummation date
specified above. This
transfer of Improvements
Pertaining to the Realty is
subject to California Uni-
form Commercial Code
Section 6106.
This transfer of only those
certain items of Improve-
ments Pertaining to the
Realty is not a normal bulk
sale of the business. Said
transfer does not include
the transfer of any li-
censes, stock in trade,
goodwill, or any other
transfer relating to the
business, other than the
purchase of those certain
items of Improvements
Pertaining to the Realty,
which are considered
items through the pur-
chase of the real property
by the Transferee.
Date: October 17, 2019
Meta Housing Corporation
1S/ By: Chris Maffris
Name: Chris Maffris
Its: Executive Vice Presid-
ent
11/21/19
CNS-3314643#
HUNTINGTON HAR-
BOUR SUN-JOURNAL
Huntington Harbour
Sun-Journal
11/21/2019 - 89887

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
OF

BULK SALE
NOTICE TO CRDITORS
OF TRANSFER
IMPROVEMENTS
PERTAINING TO THE
REALTY

(SECS. 6101-6107
u.c.C.)

No. 096-111-41

Notice is hereby given to
creditors having an in-
terest in certain items of
Improvements Pertaining
to the Realty that a trans-
fer is about to be made
only to those certain items
of Improvements Pertain-
ing to the Realty (fixtures
and equipment) and loc-
ated ONLY at the busi-
ness address set forth
herein. This transaction is
NOT concerned with any
other address at which
said Transferor might be
located. Said list of Im-
provements Pertaining to
the Realty is on file in the
office of the Transferee
and any and all inquiries
should be made at said of-
fice, telephone number is:
OFFICE: (949) 724-3159,
person of contact Carly
Beard
The name and business
address of the intended
transferor is:
Cris Fitness and Nutrition,
Hilda Patricia Garcia and
Cristian M. C. Escobedo
7134 Westminster
Boulevard Westminster,
CA 92683

The location in California
of the chief executive of-
fice or principal business
office of the intended
transferor is (SAME AS
ABOVE)
The name and business
address of the intended
transferee is:
Meta Housing Corporation
11150 W Olympic Blvd.
#620
Los Angeles, CA 90064
The property pertinent
hereto is described in gen-
eral as Improvements Per-
taining to the Realty of that
certain business known
as:
Cris Fitness and Nutrition,
Hilda Patricia Garcia and
Cristian M. C. Escobedo
The said transfer of the
items of Improvements
Pertaining to the Realty in-
tended to be consum-
mated, and all claims may
be filed, at the office of:
Commonwealth Land Title
Company
Attention: Carly Braed
4100 Newport Beach, CA
92660
This transaction shall
close on or after Decem-
ber 11, 2019, and the last
day for filing claims by any
creditor of said items of
Improvements Pertaining
to the Realty, shall be
December 10, 2019, which
is the business day before
the consummation date
specified above. This
transfer of Improvements
Pertaining to the Realty is
subject to California Uni-
form Commercial Code
Section 6106.
This transfer of only those
certain items of Improve-
ments Pertaining to the
Realty is not a normal bulk
sale of the business. Said
transfer does not include
the transfer of any Ii-
censes, stock in trade,
goodwill, or any other
transfer relating to the
business, other than the
purchase of those certain
items of Improvements
Pertaining to the Realty,
which are considered
items through the pur-
chase of the real property
by the Transferee.
Date: October 17, 2019
Meta Housing Corporation
/S/ By: Chris Maffris
Name: Chris Maffris
Its: Executive Vice Presid-
ent
11/21/19
CNS-3314649#
HUNTINGTON HAR-
BOUR SUN-JOURNAL
Huntington Harbour
Sun-Journal
11/21/2019 - 89889

NOTICE OF PUBLIC
HEARING

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIV-
EN that the Planning
Commission of the City
of Seal Beach will hold a
public hearing on
Monday, December 2,
2019 at 7:00 p.m. in the
City Council Chambers,
211 Eighth Street, Seal
Beach, California, to
consider the following
item:

MINOR USE PERMIT 19-
7. Request for a Minor Use
Permit to allow the opera-
tion of an Automated Tell-
er Machine (ATM) on the
exterior of a commercal
structure located within the
General Commercial (GC)
zoning area.

Environmental
Review:This project is de-
termined to be a Class 1
(Existing Facilities) Cat-
egorical Exemption pursu-
ant to Section 15301 of the
Guidelines for the Califor-
nia Environmental Quality
Act (Public Resources
Code Section 21000 et
seq.) for permitting of the
operation of an Auto-
mated Teller Machine
(ATM) with little or no ex-
pansion of the existing
use.

Property Owner:0Old
Ranch Town Center

Applicant:John Sanchez
for Financial Partners
Credit Union

Subject Location:12410
Seal Beach Blvd — Suite E

At the above time and
place all interested per-
sons may be heard if so
desired. If you challenge
the proposed actions in
court, you may be limited
to raising only those is-
sues you or someone else
raised at the public hear-
ing described in this no-
tice, or in written corres-
pondence delivered to the
City of Seal Beach at, or
prior to, the public hearing.

Steve Fowler
Interim Director of Com-
munity Development
Planning Commission
Secretary
Submitted to the SUN
Newspaper this 14th day
of November 2019
Seal Beach Sun
11/21/2019 - 89890

NOTICE OF PUBLIC
HEARING

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIV-
EN that the Planning
Commission of the City
of Seal Beach will hold a
public hearing on
Monday, December 2,
2019 at 7:00 p.m. in the
City Council Chambers,
211 Eighth Street, Seal
Beach, California, to
consider the following
item:

ACROSS

1. Shelter for pi-
geons

5. Popular lit genre
8. Used to harvest
agave

11. Wintertime ac-
cessory

13. “Gandalf” actor
McKellen

14. Taxis

15. Political plot
16. Public television
17. Nigerian ethnic
group

18. Informal loan
clubs
20. “Wheel of For-
tune” host
21.CCC
22. North, South
and Central make
them up
25. In an early way
30. Lied down in

rest

31. Female hip-hop
trio

32. Improves

33. Genus of mack-
erel sharks

MINOR USE PERMIT 19-
8. Request for a Minor Use
Permit to allow the interior
and exterior remodel of an
existing two-story single-
family residence that is
nonconforming due to lot
coverage within the Resid-
ential Low Density (RLD-9)
zoning area.

Environmental
Review:This project is de-
termined to be a Class 1
(Existing Facility) Categor-
ical Exemption pursuant to
Section 15301 of the
Guidelines for the Califor-
nia Environmental Quality
Act (Public Resources
Code Section 21000 et
seq.) for the permitting of
the remodel at an existing
nonconforming two-story
single-family residence
that only requires minor
modification to complete
the work.

Property Owner:The Jade
Cove Trust

Applicant:German Melgar

Subject Location:421 Jade
Cove Way

At the above time and
place all interested per-
sons may be heard if so
desired. If you challenge
the proposed actions in
court, you may be limited
to raising only those is-
sues you or someone else
raised at the public hear-
ing described in this no-
tice, or in written corres-
pondence delivered to the
City of Seal Beach at, or
prior to, the public hearing.

38. Electronic coun-
termeasures

41. Emerging

43. Balkan body of
water

45. A type of deliv-
ery

47. Ancient king-
dom near Dead Sea
49. Title given to a
monk

50. Partner to
“oohed”

55. “Luther” actor
Idris

56. Supporting pin
(nautical)

57. Golden peas
plant

59. One point north
of northeast

60. Unit of measure-
ment

61. Where clothes
hang

62. Opposite of
night

63. A way to change
color

64. Korean indepen-
dence proponent
Syngman

DOWN

1. Reciprocal of
sine

2. Political organi-
zation

3. Defunct funk
record label

4. Geological times
5. One who drinks
slowly

Steve Fowler
Interim Director of Com-
munity Development
Planning Commission
Secretary
Submitted to the SUN
Newspaper this 14th day
of November 2019
Seal Beach Sun
11/21/2019 - 89892

ORDINANCE 1681 AN
ORDINANCE OF THE
CITY OF SEAL BEACH
CITY COUNCIL AMEND-
ING THE CITY OF SEAL
BEACH MUNICIPAL
CODE BY MODIFYING
TITLE 9 CHAPTER 9.60
BUILDING CODE
THEREOF AND ADOPT-
ING BY REFERENCE
THE 2019 CALIFORNIA
BUILDING CODE, 2019
CALIFORNIA RESIDEN-
TIAL CODE, 2019 CALI-
FORNIA ELECTRICAL
CODE, 2019 CALIFOR-
NIA MECHANICAL
CODE, 2019 CALIFOR-
NIA PLUMBING CODE,
2019 CALIFORNIA FIRE
CODE AND 2018 INTER-
NATIONAL SWIMMING
POOL AND SPA CODE
WITH CERTAIN AMEND-
MENTS, ADDITIONS
AND DELETIONS
THERETO THE SEAL
BEACH CITY COUNCIL
DOES ORDAIN AS FOL-
LOWS: Section 1. Find-
ings.

A. California law requires
that on January 1, 2020,
all portions of the 2020
California Code of Regula-
tions Title 24 will be effect-
ive within the City: and,

B. The City may amend
the provisions of the Cali-

fornia Code of Regula-
tions Title 24 provided ex-
press findings for each
amendment, addition or
deletion is made based
upon climatic, topographic-
al or geological conditions.
C. The City shall file the
amendments, additions or
deletions shall be filed with
California Building Stand-
ards Commission.

D. The City of Seal Beach
is located in a densely
populated coastal area in
the northwest portion of
Orange that is more prone
to high winds, earth-
quakes, and fire, more dif-
ficult for firefighters to ac-
cess than many other
areas in California.

E. The Building Official
has recommended modify-
ing certain Parts of Califor-
nia Code of Regulations
Title 24 due to local condi-
tions in the City of Seal
Beach.

F. The findings supporting
the necessity for the
amendments to building
standards herein are con-
tained in Attachment A to
this ordinance in accord-
ance with California Health
and Safety Code Section
18941.5 and are incorpor-
ated by reference herein.

G. In accordance with
Section 15061(b)(3) of
Title 14 of the California
Code of Regulations, the
adoption of local amend-
ments to the California
Building Standards Code,
and amending the Seal
Beach Municipal Code,
are exempt from the provi-
sions of the California En-

vironmental Quality Act.
Section 2. The purpose of
this ordinance is to adopt
by reference and amend
the California Code of
Regulations, Title 24, Part
2 California Building Code,
Part 2.5 California Resid-
ential Code, Part 3 Califor-
nia Electrical Code, Part 4
California Mechanical
Code, Part 5 California
Plumbing code and Part 9
California Fire Code and
International Pool and Spa
Code. Therefore, the Seal
Beach Municipal Code is
hereby amended by re-
pealing Section 9.60.020
California Codes Adopted
by Reference and
Amended and 9.60.040
Pool and Spa Code from
Chapter 9.60 and substi-
tuting with new Section
9.60.020 California Codes
Adopted by Reference and
Amended and 9.60.040
Pool and Spa Code all to
read as follows:
CHAPTER 9.60 BUILD-
ING CODE
9.60.020CALIFORNIA
CODES ADOPTED BY
REFERENCE AND AM-
MENDED
9.60.020.010 BUILDING
CODE ADOPTED BY
REFERENCE AND
AMENDED
9.60.020.010.10 CALI-
FORNIA BUILDING
CODE ADOPTED BY
REFERENCE
Chapter 1 through 35 and
Appendices F, | and J of
2019 California Building
Code, Title 24 Part 2 of
California Code of Regula-
tions, as published by the
California Building Stand-
ards Commission are

6. Nightclub enter-
tainment

7. Establish in one’s
mind

8. Restaurants

9. Off-Broadway
theater award

10. Requests

12. You don’t watch
to catch it

14. Intestinal
pouches

19. Satisfy

23. Wet dirt

24. Regularly re-
peated

25. Before

26. The color of
Valentine’s Day

27. Indicates near
28. Bon __: witty
remark

29. One’s holdings
34. Request

35. Prefix meaning
“badly”

36. Midway between
north and northeast
37. Ottoman mili-

41.Pie ____mode
42. Mars crater

44. Sports TV per-
sonality

45. Taxi driver

46. Abba __, Israeli
politician

47. The sick are
sometimes on it
48. Relating to
olives

51. Swiss river

52. Grayish white
53. A way to en-

tary title grave
39. Teased 54. Where Coach K.
40. Happily works

58. Midway between
south and southeast



22

SUN NEWSPAPERS

Thursday, Nov. 21, 2019

PUBLIC NOTICES

714.530.7622 * legals@sunnews.org

Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB

Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB

hereby adopted by refer-
ence pursuant to the provi-
sions of Sections 50022.1
through 50022.10 of the
Government Code of the
State of California as
though fully set forth
herein, and made a part of
the Seal Beach Municipal
Code with the same force
and effect as though set
out herein in full, including
all of the regulations, revi-
sions, conditions and
terms contained therein
except that those certain
sections thereof which are
necessary to meet local
conditions as hereinafter
set forth in Section
9.60.020.010.20 of this
Code are hereby repealed,
added or amended to read
as set forth therein. The
administration of the Build-
ing Code shall be as set
forth in Section 9.60.010 of
this Code. Not less than
one copy of said 2019
California Building Code,
Title 24 Part 2 of Califor-
nia Code of Regulations
together with any and all
amendments thereto pro-
posed by the City of Seal
Beach, has been and is
now filed in the office of
the Community Develop-
ment Department and
shall be remain on file with
Building Official, and shall
collectively be known as
the City of Seal Beach
Building Code and may
be cited as Section
9.60.020.010 of the Seal
Beach Municipal Code.
9.60.020.010.20 CALI-
FORNIA BUILDING
CODE AMENDED
Chapter 1, 9, and 18 of
2019 California Building
Code, Title 24 Part 2 of
California Code of Regula-
tions adopted by refer-
ence as the Building Code
of the City of Seal Beach,
are hereby amended, de-
leted or added as follows:
1-Chapter 1 Division Il is
deleted in its entirety.
2-Chapter 9 is amended
in its entirety to read:
Chapter 9 FIRE PROTEC-
TION SYSTEMS. Chapter
9 of Building Code is de-
leted in its entirety and re-
placed with Chapter 9 of
the California Fire Code as
adopted and amended by
City of Seal Beach Muni-
cipal Code Section
9.60.020.060
9.60.020.020RESIDEN-
TIAL CODE ADOPTED
BY REFERENCE AND
AMENDED
9.60.020.020.10 CALI-
FORNIA RESIDENTIAL
CODE ADOPTED BY
REFERENCE
Chapters 2 through 10,
Chapter 44 and Appendix
H,J ,Q,RandS of 2019
California Residential
Code, Title 24 Part 2.5 of
California Code of Regula-
tions, and Appendix J of
2019 California Building
Code, Title 24 Part 2 of
California Code of Regula-
tions as published by the
California Building Stand-
ards Commission, are
hereby adopted by refer-
ence pursuant to the provi-
sions of Sections 50022.1
through 50022.10 of the
Government Code of the
State of California as
though fully set forth
herein, and made a part of
the Seal Beach Municipal
Code with the same force
and effect as though set
out herein in full, including
all of the regulations, revi-
sions, conditions and
terms contained therein
except that those certain
sections thereof which are
necessary to meet local
conditions as hereinafter
set forth in Section
9.60.020.020.20 of this
Code are hereby repealed,
added or amended to read
as set forth therein. The
administration of the Res-
idential Code shall be as
set forth in Section

9.60.010 of this Code. Not
less than one copy of said
2019 California Residen-
tial Code, Title 24 Part 2.5
of California Code of Reg-
ulations together with any
and all amendments
thereto proposed by the
City of Seal Beach, has
been and is now filed in
the office of the Com-
munity Development De-
partment and shall be re-
main on file with Building
Official, and shall collect-
ively be known as the City
of Seal Beach Residen-
tial Code and may be
cited as Section
9.60.020.020 of the Seal
Beach Municipal Code.
9.60.020.020.20 CALI-
FORNIA RESIDENTIAL
CODE AMENDED
Chapter 3 of 2019 Califor-
nia Residential Code, Title
24 Part 2.5 of California
Code of Regulations adop-
ted by reference as the
Residential Code of the
City of Seal Beach, are
hereby amended, deleted
or added as follows:
1-Section R301.1.1.3.2 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

R301.1.1.3.2 Wood
Frame Structures. The
Building Official shall re-
quire construction docu-
ments to be approved and
stamped by a California li-
censed architect or engin-
eer for all dwellings of
wood frame construction
more than two stories and
basement in height loc-
ated in Seismic Design
Category A, B, or C. Not-
withstanding other sec-
tions of law, the law estab-
lishing these provisions is
found in Business and
Professions Code Sec-
tions 5537 and 6737.1.
The Building Official shall
require construction docu-
ments to be approved and
stamped by a California li-
censed architect or engin-
eer for all dwellings of
wood frame construction
more than one story in
height or with a basement
located in Seismic Design
Category DO, D1, or D2 or
E

2-Section R313 Automat-
ic Fire Sprinkler System
is amended in its en-
tirety to read:

R313 Automatic Fire
Sprinkler System. Sec-
tion 903 of the Chapter 9
of Seal Beach Fire Code
(Title 9 Chapter 9.60 Sec-
tion 9.60.020.060 Fire
Code) is adopted by refer-
ence to be the section
R313 of the Residential
Code.
9.60.020.030ELECTRIC-
AL CODE ADOPTED BY
REFERENCE
9.60.020.030 CALIFOR-
NIA ELECTRICAL CODE
ADOPTED BY REFER-
ENCE

89.102 through 89.114 of
Article 89, Article 90,
Chapters 1 through 9, and
Annexes , B,
C,D,EF,G,H, | and J of
2019 California Electrical
Code, Title 24 Part 3 of
California Code of Regula-
tions, is hereby adopted by
reference pursuant to the
provisions of Sections
50022.1 through 50022.10
of the Government Code
of the State of California
as though fully set forth
herein, and made a part of
the Seal Beach Municipal
Code with the same force
and effect as though set
out herein in full, including
all of the regulations, revi-
sions, conditions and
terms contained therein.
The administration of the
Electrical Code shall be as
set forth in Section
9.60.010 of this Code.Not
less than one copy of said
2019 California Electrical
Code, Title 24 Part 3 of
California Code of Regula-
tions together with any and
all amendments thereto
proposed by the City of
Seal Beach, has been and

is now filed in the office of
the Community Develop-
ment Department and
shall be remain on file with
Building Official, and shall
collectively be known as
the City of Seal Beach
Electrical Code and may
be cited as Section
9.60.020.030 of the Seal
Beach Municipal Code.
9.60.020.040 MECHANIC-
AL CODE ADOPTED BY
REFERENCE
9.60.020.040 CALIFOR-
NIA MECHANICAL CODE
ADOPTED BY REFER-
ENCE

Division | Sections 1.2.0
through 1.14.0 of Chapter
1, Chapters 2 through 17
and Appendices B, C and
D of 2019 California
Mechanical Code, Title 24
Part 4 of California Code
of Regulations, as pub-
lished by the California
Building Standards Com-
mission are hereby adop-
ted by reference pursuant
to the provisions of Sec-
tions 50022.1 through
50022.10 of the Govern-
ment Code of the State of
California as though fully
set forth herein, and made
a part of the Seal Beach
Municipal Code with the
same force and effect as
though set out herein in
full, including all of the reg-
ulations, revisions, condi-
tions and terms contained
therein. The administra-
tion of the Mechanical
Code shall be as set forth
in Section 9.60.010 of this
Code.Not less than one
copy of said 2019 Califor-
nia Mechanical Code, Title
24 Part 4 of California
Code of Regulations to-
gether with any and all
amendments thereto pro-
posed by the City of Seal
Beach, has been and is
now filed in the office of
the Community Develop-
ment Department and
shall be remain on file with
Building Official, and shall
collectively be known as
the City of Seal Beach
Mechanical Code and
may be cited as Section
9.60.020.040 of the Seal
Beach Municipal Code.
9.60.020.050PLUMBING
CODE ADOPTED BY
REFERENCE
9.60.020.050 CALIFOR-
NIA PLUMBING CODE
ADOPTED BY REFER-
ENCE

Division | Sections 1.2.0
through 1.14.0 of Chapter
1, Chapters 2 through 17
and Appendices A, B,D,H,|
and J of 2019 California
Plumbing Code, Title 24
Part 5 of California Code
of Regulations, as pub-
lished by the California
Building Standards Com-
mission are hereby adop-
ted by reference pursuant
to the provisions of Sec-
tions 50022.1 through
50022.10 of the Govern-
ment Code of the State of
California as though fully
set forth herein, and made
a part of the Seal Beach
Municipal Code with the
same force and effect as
though set out herein in
full, including all of the reg-
ulations, revisions, condi-
tions and terms contained
therein. The administra-
tion of the Plumbing Code
shall be as set forth in
Section 9.60.010 of this
Code.Not less than one
copy of said 2019 Califor-
nia Plumbing Code, Title
24 Part 5 of California
Code of Regulations to-
gether with any and all
amendments thereto pro-
posed by the City of Seal
Beach, has been and is
now filed in the office of
the Community Develop-
ment Department and
shall be remain on file with
Building Official, and shall
collectively be known as
the City of Seal Beach
Plumbing Code and may
be cited as Section
9.60.020.050 of the Seal

Beach Municipal Code.
9.60.020.060FIRE CODE
ADOPTED BY REFER-
ENCE AND AMENDED
9.60.020.060.10 CALI-
FORNIA FIRE CODE AD-
OPTED BY REFERENCE
Chapters 1 Division | and
Division Il, Chapters 2
through 80 and Appen-
dices B, BB, C, and CC of
2019 California Fire Code,
Title 24 Part 9 of Califor-
nia Code of Regulations,
as published by the Cali-
fornia Building Standards
Commission are hereby
adopted by reference pur-
suant to the provisions of
Sections 50022.1 through
50022.10 of the Govern-
ment Code of the State of
California as though fully
set forth herein, and made
a part of the Seal Beach
Municipal Code with the
same force and effect as
though set out herein in
full, including all of the reg-
ulations, revisions, condi-
tions and terms contained
therein except that those
certain sections thereof
which are necessary to
meet local conditions as
hereinafter set forth in
Section 9.60.020.060.20 of
this Code are hereby re-
pealed, added or amended
to read as set forth therein.
Not less than one copy of
said 2019 California Fire
Code, Title 24 Part 9 of
California Code of Regula-
tions together with any and
all amendments thereto
proposed by the City of
Seal Beach, has been and
is now filed in the office of
the Community Develop-
ment Department and
shall be remain on file with
Building Official, and shall
collectively be known as
the City of Seal Beach
Fire Code and may be
cited as Section
9.60.020.060 of the Seal
Beach Municipal Code.
9.60.020.060.20 CALI-
FORNIA FIRE CODE
MODIFIED

Chapter 1, 2, 3,4, 5,9, 12,
28, 49, 50, 56, 57, 58 and
80 of 2019 California Fire
Code, Title 24 Part 9 of
California Code of Regula-
tions adopted by refer-
ence as the Fire Code of
the City of Seal Beach, are
hereby amended, deleted
or added as follows:
1-Division Il Section
101.1 is amended in its
entirety to read:

101.1 Title. These regula-
tions shall be knowns the
Fire Code of City of Seal
Beach hereinafter referred
to as “this code”
2-Division Il Section
110.4 is amended to
read:

110.4 Violation penalties.
Persons who shall violate
a provision of this code or
shall fail to comply with
any of the requirements
thereof or shall fail to com-
ply with any issued orders
or notices or who shall
erect, install, alter, repair
or do work in violation of
the approved construction
documents or directive of
the fire code official, or of
a permit or certificate used
under provisions of this
code, shall be subject to
penalties assessed as pre-
scribed in the OCFA Pre-
vention Field Services ad-
opted fee schedule. Each
day that a violation contin-
ues after due notice has
been served shall be
deemed a separate of-
fense.

3-A new Division Il Sec-
tion 110.4.2 is added to
read:

110.4.2 Infraction and
misdemeanor. Persons
operating or maintaining
any occupancy, premises
or vehicle subject to this
code that shall permit any
fire or life safety hazard to
exist on premises under
their control shall be guilty
of an infraction. Persons
who fail to take immediate
action to abate a fire or life

safety hazard when
ordered or notified to do so
by the chief or a duly au-
thorized representative are
guilty of a misdemeanor.
4-Section 202 is
amended to add the fol-
lowing definitions;
OCFA: Orange County
Fire Authority, fire author-
ity having jurisdiction.
SPARK ARRESTER. A
listed device constructed
of noncombustible materi-
al specifically for the pur-
pose of meeting one of the
following conditions:

1. Removing and retaining
carbon and other flam-
mable particles/debris
from the exhaust flow of
an internal combustion en-
gine in accordance with
California Vehicle Code
Section 38366.

2. Fireplaces that burn sol-
id fuel in accordance with
California Building Code
Chapter 28.

5-Section 304.1.2 is
amended in its entirety
to read as follows:
304.1.2 Vegetation.
Weeds, grass, vines or
other growth that is cap-
able of being ignited and
endangering property,
shall be cut down and re-
moved by the owner or oc-
cupant of the premises.
Vegetation clearance re-
quirement in urban-wild-
land interface areas shall
be in accordance with
Chapter 49. Type, amount,
arrangement, and main-
tenance of vegetation in a
fuel modification area, in-
terior slope, or similarly
hazardous area shall be in
accordance with OCFA
Guideline C-05 “Vegeta-
tion Management
Guideline—Technical
Design for New Construc-
tion, Fuel Modification
Plans, and Maintenance
Program.”

6-A new Section 305.6 is
added to read:

305.6 Hazardous condi-
tions. Outdoor fires burn-
ing wood or other solid fuel
are not allowed when any
of the following conditions
applies:

1. when predicted sus-
tained winds exceed 8
MPH and relative humidity
is less than 25%, or a red
flag condition has been
declared

2. when an official sign
was caused to be posted
by the fire code official, or
a public announcement is
made

No outdoor fires using any
fuel type are permitted
when predicted sustained
winds exceed 20 MPH or
when such fires present a
hazard as determined by
the fire code official.

7-A new Section 305.7 is
added to read:

305.7 Disposal of rub-
bish. Rubbish, trash or
combustible waste materi-
al shall be burned only
within an approved inciner-
ator and in accordance
with Section 307.2.1.
8-A new Section 307.6
added to read:

307.6 Outdoor Fire-
places, Fire Pits, Fire
Rings, or similar devices
used at Group R Occu-
pancies. Outdoor fire-
places, fire pits, fire rings,
or similar exterior devices
used at Group R shall
comply with this section.
Exception: Barbeques,
grills, and other portable
devices intended solely for
cooking.

9-A new Section 307.6.1
added to read:

307.6.1 Gas-fueled
devices. Outdoor fire-
places, fire pits and simil-
ar devices fueled by natur-
al gas or liquefied-petro-
leum gas are allowed
when approved by the
Building Department and
the device is designed to
only burn a gas flame and
not wood or other solid
fuel. At R-3 occupancies,
combustible construction

and vegetation shall not be
located within three feet of
an atmospheric column
that extends vertically from
the perimeter of the
device. At other R occu-
pancies, the minimum dis-
tance shall be ten feet.
Where a permanent Build-
ing Department approved
hood and vent is installed,
combustible construction
may encroach upon this
column between the bot-
tom of the hood and the
vent opening. Where
chimneys or vents are in-
stalled, they shall have a
spark arrester as defined
in Section 202.

10-A new Section 307.6.2
added to read:

307.6.2 Devices using
wood or fuels other than
natural gas or liquefied-
petroleum gas. Perman-
ent outdoor fireplaces
burning wood or other sol-
id fuel shall be construc-
ted in accordance with the
California Building Code
with clearance from com-
bustible construction and
building openings as re-
quired therein. Fires in a
fireplace shall be con-
tained within a firebox with
an attached chimney. The
opening in the face of the
firebox shall have an in-
stalled and maintained
method of arresting
sparks. The burning of
wood or other solid fuel in
a device is not allowed
within 25 feet of combust-
ible structures unless with-
in an approved permanent
fireplace, Conditions which
could cause a fire to
spread within 25 feet of a
structure or to vegetation
shall be eliminated prior to
ignition. Fires in devices
burning wood or solid fuel
shall be in accordance
with Sections 305, 307,
and 308.Exceptions:

1. Portable fireplaces and
fire rings/pits equipped
with a device to arrest
sparks shall be located at
least 3’ from combustible
construction at R-3 occu-
pancies,

2. Portable fireplaces, and
fire pits/rings equipped
with a device to arrest
sparks, shall be located at
least 15 feet from com-
bustible structures at oth-
er R occupancies.

11-A new Section
307.6.2.1 added to read:
307.6.2.1 Where prohib-
ited.

The burning of wood and
other solid fuels shall not
be conducted within a fuel
modification zone, Wildfire
Risk Area (WRA), Wild-
land-Urban Interface Area
(WUI), or in locations
where conditions could
cause the spread of fire to
the WRA or WUI. Excep-
tions:

1. Permanent fireplaces
that are not located in a
fuel modification zone
2. Where determined by
the Fire Code Official that
the location or design of
the device should reason-
ably prevent the start of a
wildfire.

12-Section 308.1.6.3 Sky
lanterns is hereby
amended to read:
308.1.6.3 Sky lanterns. A
person shall not ignite, re-
lease, or cause to be re-
leased a sky lantern.
13-A new Section 321
added to read:

321 Fuel Modification
Requirements for New
Construction. All new
structures and facilities ad-
joining land containing
hazardous combustible ve-
getation shall be ap-
proved and in accordance
with the requirements of
OCFA Guideline C-05 “Ve-
getation Management
Guideline — Technical
Design for New Construc-
tion Fuel Modification
Plans and Maintenance
Program.”

14-A new Section 322
added to read:

322 Clearance of brush
or vegetation growth
from roadways. The fire
code official is authorized
to cause areas within 10
feet (3048 mm) on each
side of portions of high-
ways and private streets
which are improved, de-
signed or ordinarily used
for vehicular traffic, to be
cleared of flammable ve-
getation and other com-
bustible growth. Measure-
ment shall be from the
flow-line or the end of the
improved edge of the
roadway surfaces. Excep-
tion: Single specimens of
trees, ornamental shrub-
bery or cultivated ground
cover such as green
grass, ivy, succulents or
similar plants used as
ground covers, provided
that they do not form a
means of readily transmit-
ting fire.

15-A new Section 323
added to read:

323 Unusual circum-
stances. The fire code of-
ficial may suspend en-
forcement of the vegeta-
tion management require-
ments and require reason-
able alternative measures
designed to advance the
purpose of this code if de-
termined that in any spe-
cific case that any of the
following conditions exist:
1.Difficult terrain.

2.Danger of erosion.
3.Presence of plants in-
cluded in any state and
federal resources agen-
cies, California Native
Plant Society and county-
approved list of wildlife,
plants, rare, endangered
and/or threatened species.
4.Stands or groves of
trees or heritage trees.
5.0ther unusual circum-
stances that make strict
compliance with the clear-
ance of vegetation provi-
sions undesirable or im-
practical.

16-A new Section 324
added to read:

324 Use of equipment.
Except as otherwise
provided in this section, no
person shall use, operate,
or cause to be operated in,
upon or adjoining any haz-
ardous fire area any in-
ternal combustion engine
which uses hydrocarbon
fuels, unless the engine is
equipped with a spark ar-
rester as defined in Sec-
tion 202 maintained in ef-
fective working order, or
the engine is constructed,
equipped and maintained
for the prevention of fire.
Exceptions:

1.Engines used to provide
motor power for trucks,
truck tractors, buses, and
passenger vehicles, ex-
cept motorcycles, are not
subject to this section if
the exhaust system is
equipped with a muffler as
defined in the Vehicle
Code of the State of Cali-
fornia.

2.Turbocharged engines
are not subject to this sec-
tion if all exhausted gases
pass through the rotating
turbine wheel, there is no
exhaust bypass to the at-
mosphere, and the tur-
bocharger is in good
mechanical condition
17-A new Section 324.1
Use of Equipment and
Devices Generating
Heat, Sparks or Open
Flames added to read:
324.1 Equipment and
devices generating heat,
sparks or open flames.
During any time of the
year within Wildfire Risk
Areas, within or immedi-
ately adjacent to any
forest- or brush-covered
land or non-irrigated
grass-covered land, no
person shall use or oper-
ate any welding equip-
ment, cutting torches, tar
pots, grinding devices, or
other tools or equipment
that may produce a spark,
fire, or flame that could
result in a wildfire without



Thursday, Nov. 21, 2019

SUN NEWSPAPERS

23

PUBLIC NOTICES

714.530.7622 * legals@sunnews.org

Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB

Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB

doing the following:
1.First clearing away all
flammable material, includ-
ing snags, from the area
around such operation for
a distance of 30 feet or
other approved method to
reduce fire spread into the
wildlands. If 30-foot clear-
ing cannot be achieved,
then an alternate method
shall be approved by the
AHJ prior to work starting.
2.Maintain one service-
able round point shovel
with an overall length of
not less than forty-six (46)
inches and one backpack
pump water-type fire extin-
guisher fully equipped and
ready for use at the imme-
diate area during the oper-
ation.

3.Stop work when winds
are 8 MPH or greater dur-
ing periods when relative
humidity is less than 25%,
or a red flag condition has
been declared or public
announcement is made,
when an official sign was
caused to be posted by
the fire code official, or
when such fires present a
hazard as determined by
the fire code official.

4 Keep a cell phone
nearby and call 911 imme-
diate in case of fire.

18-A new Section 324.2
added to read:

324.2 Spark arresters.
Spark arresters shall com-
ply with Section 202, and
when affixed to the ex-
haust system of engines or
vehicles subject to Sec-
tion 324 shall not be
placed or mounted in such
a manner as to allow
flames or heat from the ex-
haust system to ignite any
flammable material.
19-Section 407.5 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

407.5 Hazardous Materi-
als Inventory Statement.
Where required by the fire
code official, each applica-
tion for a permit shall in-
clude OCFA’s Chemical
Classification Packet in ac-
cordance with Section
5001.5.2.

20-Section 501.1 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

501.1 Scope. Fire ser-
vice features for buildings,
structures and premises
shall comply with this
chapter and, where re-
quired by the fire code offi-
cial, with OCFA Guideline
B-09, “Fire Master Plan for
Commercial & Residential
Development.” Fire ser-
vice features for buildings,
structures and premises
located in State Respons-
ibility Areas, and Local Re-
sponsibility Areas desig-
nated as Very High Haz-
ard Fire Severity Zone
shall also comply with
OCFA Guideline B-09a,
“Fire Safe Development in
State Responsibility Areas,
and Local Responsibility
Areas designated as Very
High Hazard Fire Severity
Zone”.

21-Section 510.1 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

510.1 Emergency re-
sponder radio coverage
in new buildings. All new
buildings shall have ap-
proved radio coverage for
emergency responders
within the building based
upon the existing cover-
age levels of the public
safety communication sys-
tems utilized by the juris-
diction, measured at the
exterior of the building.
This section shall not re-
quire improvement of the
existing public safety com-
munication systems. The
Emergency Responder
Radio Coverage System
shall comply with the Or-
ange County Sheriff's De-
partment, Communica-
tions and Technology Divi-
sion guidelines and spe-
cifications and, where the
functionality or perform-
ance requirements in the

California Fire Code are
more stringent, this code.
Exceptions:

1.In buildings or struc-
tures where it is determ-
ined by the fire code offi-
cial that the radio cover-
age system is not needed,
including but not limited to
the following:

a.Existing buildings or
structures, unless re-
quired by the Building Offi-
cial and OCFA for build-
ings and structures under-
going extensive remodel
and/or expansion.
b.Elevators.

c.Structures that meet all
of the following:

i.Three stories or less, and
ii.Do not have subter-
ranean storage or parking,
and

iii.Do not exceed 50,000
square feet on any single
story.

d.Structures that meet all
of the following:
i.Residential structures
four stories or less, and
ii.Constructed of wood,
and

iii.Do not have subter-
ranean storage or parking,
and

iv.Are not built integral to
an above ground multi-
story parking structure.
Should a structure that is
three stories or less and
50,000 square feet or
smaller on any single story
include subterranean stor-
age or parking, then this
ordinance shall apply only
to the subterranean areas.
2.In facilities where emer-
gency responder radio
coverage is required and
such systems, compon-
ents or equipment re-
quired could have a negat-
ive impact on the normal
operations of the facility,
the fire code official shall
have the authority to ac-
cept an automatically ac-
tivated emergency radio
coverage system.
22-Section 510.2 Emer-
gency responder radio
coverage in existing
buildings is deleted in its
entirety.

23-Section 510.3 Permit
required is deleted in its
entirety.

24-Section 903.2 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

903.2 Where required.
Approved automatic
sprinkler systems in build-
ings and structures shall
be provided when one of
the following conditions
exists:

1. New buildings: Not-
withstanding any applic-
able provisions of Sec-
tions 903.2.1 through
903.2.19, an automatic
fire-extinguishing system
shall also be installed in all
occupancies when the
total building area ex-
ceeds 5,000 square feet
as defined in Section 202,
regardless of fire areas or
allowable area, or is more
than two stories in height.
Exception: Subject to ap-
proval by the Fire Code
Official, open parking gar-
ages in accordance with
Section 406.5 of the Cali-
fornia Building Code.

2. Existing Buildings:
Notwithstanding any ap-
plicable provisions of this
code, an automatic sprink-
ler system shall be
provided in an existing
building when an addition
occurs and one of the fol-
lowing conditions exists:
a.When an addition ex-
ceeds 2000 square feet
and the resulting building
area exceeds 5000 square
feet.

Exception: Existing Group
R-3 occupancies shall
comply with Section
903.2.8 (2).
25-Section 903.2.8 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

903.2.8 Group R. An
automatic sprinkler sys-
tem installed in accord-
ance with Section 903.3

shall be provided
throughout all buildings
with a Group R fire area as
follows:

1. New Buildings: An
automatic sprinkler sys-
tem shall be installed
throughout all new build-
ings, including attached
garages.

2. Existing R-3 Build-
ings: An automatic
sprinkler system shall be
installed throughout when
one of the following condi-
tions exists:

a. All existing Group R oc-
cupancies and U-1 gar-
ages when the total area is
increased by 750 square
feet or more.

b. An automatic sprinkler
system shall be installed
throughout any existing
Group R Occupancy build-
ing when the floor area of
the Alteration or Combina-
tion of an Addition and Al-
teration, is 50% or more of
area/value of the existing
structure and where the
scope of the work ex-
poses building framing and
facilitates sprinkler installa-
tion and is such that the
Building/Fire Code Official
determines that the com-
plexity of installing a
sprinkler system would be
similar as in a new build-
ing.

c. Any addition to an exist-
ing building which has fire
sprinklers installed.
Exceptions:

1. Existing Group R-3 oc-
cupancies converted to
Group R-3.1 occupancies
not housing bedridden cli-
ents, not housing nonam-
bulatory clients above the
first floor and not housing
clients above the second
floor.

2. Existing Group R-3 oc-
cupancies converted to
Group R-3.1 occupancies
housing only one bedrid-
den client and complying
with Section 425.8.3.3.
3. Pursuant to Health and
Safety Code Section
13113 occupancies hous-
ing ambulatory children
only, none of whom are
mentally ill or mentally re-
tarded, and the buildings
or portions thereof in
which such children are
housed are not more than
two stories in height, and
buildings or portions there-
of housing such children
have an automatic fire
alarm system activated by
approved smoke detect-
ors.

4. Pursuant to Health and
Safety Code Section
13143.6 occupancies li-
censed for protective so-
cial care which house am-
bulatory clients only, none
of whom is a child (under
the age of 18 years), or
who is elderly (65 years of
age or over).

When not used in accord-
ance with Section 504.2 or
506.3 an automatic sprink-
ler system installed in ac-
cordance with Section
903.3.1.2 shall be allowed
in Group R-2.1 occupan-
cies. An automatic sprink-
ler system designed in ac-
cordance with Section
903.3.1.3 shall not be util-
ized in Group R-2.1 or R-4
occupancies.

26-A new Section
903.3.5.3 is added to
read:

903.3.5.3 Hydraulically
calculated systems. The
design of hydraulically cal-
culated fire sprinkler sys-
tems shall not exceed 90%
of the water supply capa-
city. Exception: When
static pressure exceeds
100 psi, and required by
the Fire Code Official, the
fire sprinkler system shall
not exceed water supply
capacity specified by Ta-
ble 903.3.5.3.
27-Section 1201.1.1 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

1201.1.1 Other Systems
Where required by the fire
code official, other sys-

tems and operations in-
cluding but not limited to
battery systems assembly,
battery reconditioning and
storage, research and de-
velopment of battery stor-
age systems, electric
vehicle manufacturing and
testing, and battery char-
ging systems for cars and
carts inside of buildings or
structures, shall comply
with this chapter.
28-Section 2801.2 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

2801.2 Permit. Permits
shall be required as set
forth in Section 105.6 and
105.6.29.

29-Section 2808.2 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

2808.2 Storage site. Stor-
age sites shall be level
and on solid ground, elev-
ated soil lifts or other all-
weather surface. Sites
shall be thoroughly
cleaned and approval ob-
tained from the fire code
official before transferring
products to the site.
30-Section 2808.3 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

2808.3 Size of piles. Piles
shall not exceed 15 feet in
height, 50 feet in width and
100 feet in length. Excep-
tion: The fire code official
is authorized to allow the
pile size to be increased
where a fire protection
plan is provided for ap-
proval that includes, but is
not limited to, the follow-
ing:

1. Storage yard areas and
materials-handling equip-
ment selection, design and
arrangement shall be
based upon sound fire pre-
vention and protection
principles.

2. Factor that lead to spon-
taneous heating shall be
identified in the plan, and
control of the various
factors shall be identified
and implemented, includ-
ing provisions for monitor-
ing the internal condition of
the pile.

3. The plan shall include
means for early fire detec-
tion and reporting to the
public fire department; and
facilities needed by the fire
department for fire extin-
guishment including a wa-
ter supply and fire hy-
drants.

4. Fire apparatus access
roads around the piles and
access roads to the top of
the piles shall be estab-
lished, identified and main-
tained.

5. Regular yard inspec-
tions by trained personnel
shall be included as part of
an effective fire preven-
tion maintenance program.
Additional fire protection
called for in the plan shall
be provided and shall be
installed in accordance
with this code. The in-
crease of the pile size
shall be based upon the
capabilities of the installed
fire protection system and
features.

31-Section 2808.4 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

2808.4. Pile separation.
Piles shall be separated
from adjacent piles by a
minimum distance of 20
feet. Additionally, piles
shall have a minimum sep-
aration of 100 feet from
combustible vegetation.
32-Section 2808.7 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

2808.7 Pile fire protec-
tion. Automatic sprinkler
protection shall be
provided in conveyor tun-
nels and combustible en-
closures that pass under a
pile. Combustible convey-
or systems and enclosed
conveyor systems shall be
equipped with an ap-
proved automatic sprink-
ler system. Oscillating
sprinklers with a sufficient
projectile reach are re-
quired to maintain a 40%

to 60% moisture content
and wet down
burning/smoldering areas.
33-Section 2808.9 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

2808.9 Material-handling
equipment. All material-
handling equipment oper-
ated by an internal com-
bustion engine shall be
provided and maintained
with an approved spark ar-
rester. Approved material-
handling equipment shall
be available for moving
wood chips, hogged ma-
terial, wood fines and raw
product during fire-fighting
operations.

34-A new Section
2808.11 is added to read:
2808.11 Temperature
control. The temperature
shall be monitored and
maintained as specified in
Sections 2808.11.1 and
2808.11.2.

2808.11.1 Pile temperat-
ure control. Piles shall be
rotated when internal tem-
perature readings are in
excess of 165 degrees
Fahrenheit.

2808.11.2 New material
temperature control.
New loads delivered to the
facility shall be inspected
and tested at the facility
entry prior to taking deliv-
ery. Material with temper-
ature exceeding 165 de-
grees Fahrenheit shall not
be accepted on the site.
New loads shall comply
with the requirements of
this chapter and be mon-
itored to verify that the
temperature remains
stable.

35-A new Section
2808.12 is added to read:
2808.12 Water Availabil-
ity. Facilities with over
2500 cubic feet shall
provide a water supply.
The minimum fire flow
shall be no less than 500
GPM @ 20 psi for a min-
imum of 1 hour duration
for pile heights up to 6 feet
and 2 hour duration for pile
heights over 6 feet. If there
is no water purveyor, an
alternate water supply with
storage tank(s) shall be
provided for fire suppres-
sion. The water supply
tank(s) shall provide a
minimum capacity of 2500
gallons per pile (maximum
30,000 gallons) for piles
not exceeding 6 feet in
height and 5000 gallons
per pile (maximum 60,000)
for piles exceeding 6 feet
in height. Water tank(s)
shall not be used for any
other purpose unless the
required fire flow is left in
reserve within the tank at
all times. An approved
method shall be provided
to maintain the required
amount of water within the
tank(s).

36-A new Section
2808.13 is added to read:
2808.13 Tipping areas
shall comply with the fol-
lowing:

1.Tipping areas shall not
exceed a maximum area
of 50 feet by 50 feet.
2_Material within a tipping
area shall not exceed 5
feet in height at any time.
3.Tipping areas shall be
separated from all piles by
a 20-foot-wide fire access
lane.

4.A fire hydrant or ap-
proved fire water supply
outlet shall be located
within 150 feet of all points
along the perimeter of the
tipping area.

5.All material within a tip-
ping area shall be pro-
cessed within 5 days of re-
ceipt.

37-A new Section
2808.14 is added to read:
2808.14 Emergency Con-
tact. The contact informa-
tion of a responsible per-
son or persons shall be
provided to the Fire De-
partment and shall be pos-
ted at the entrance to the
facility for responding
units. The responsible
party should be available

to respond to the busi-
ness in emergency situ-
ation.

38-Section 4906.3 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

4906.3 Requirements.
Hazardous vegetation and
fuels around all applicable
buildings and structure
shall be maintained in ac-
cordance with the follow-
ing laws and regulations:
1.Public Resources Code,
Section 4291.

2.California Code of Regu-
lations, Title 14, Division
1.5, Chapter 7,
Subchapter 3, Section
1299 (see guidance for im-
plementation “General
Guideline to Create De-
fensible Space”).
3.California Government
Code, Section 51182.

4 .California Code of Regu-
lations, Title 19, Division 1,
Chapter 7, Subchapter 1,
Section 3.07.

5.  OCFA Guideline C-05
“Vegetation Management
Guideline — Technical
Design for New Construc-
tion Fuel Modification
Plans and Maintenance
Program.”

39-A new Section 4908 is
added to read:

4908 Fuel Modification
Requirements for New
Construction. All new
buildings to be built or in-
stalled in a Wildfire Risk
Area shall comply with the
following:

1.Preliminary fuel modific-
ation plans shall be sub-
mitted to and approved by
the fire code official prior
to or concurrently with the
approval of any tentative
map.

2.Final fuel modification
plans shall be submitted to
and approved by the fire
code official prior to the is-
suance of a grading per-
mit.

3.The fuel modification
plans shall meet the criter-
ia set forth in the Fuel
Modification Section of
OCFA Guideline C-05 “Ve-
getation Management
Guideline — Technical
Design for New Construc-
tion Fuel Modification
Plans and Maintenance
Program.”

3.1The fuel modification
plan shall include provi-
sions for the maintenance
of the fuel modification in
perpetuity.

4.The fuel modification
plan may be altered if con-
ditions change. Any alter-
ations to the fuel modifica-
tion areas shall have prior
approval from the fire code
official.

5.All elements of the fuel
modification plan shall be
maintained in accordance
with the approved plan
and are subject to the en-
forcement process out-
lined in the Fire Code.
40-Section 5001.5.2 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

5001.5.2 Hazardous Ma-
terials Inventory State-
ment (HMIS). Where re-
quired by the fire code offi-
cial, an application for a
permit shall include Or-
ange County Fire Author-
ity’s Chemical Classifica-
tion Packet, which shall be
completed and approved
prior to approval of plans,
and/or the storage, use or
handling of chemicals on
the premises. The Chem-
ical Classification Packet
shall include the following
information:

1. Product Name.

2. Component.

3. Chemical Abstract Ser-
vice (CAS) number.

4. Location where stored
or used.

5. Container size.

6. Hazard classification.

7. Amount in storage.

8. Amount in use-closed
systems.

9. Amount in use-open
systems.

41-A new Section
5003.1.1.1 is added to

read:

5003.1.1.1 Extremely
Hazardous Substances.
No person shall use or
store any amount of ex-
tremely hazardous sub-
stances (EHS) in excess
of the disclosable amounts
(see Health and Safety
Code Section 25500 et al)
in a residential zoned or
any residentially de-
veloped property.
42-A new Section 5608.2
is added to read:
5608.2 Firing. All fire-
works display, regardless
of mortar, device, or shell
size, shall be electrically
fired.

43-A new Section 5608.3
is added to read:
Section 5608.3 Applica-
tion for Permit. A dia-
gram of the grounds on
which the display is to be
held showing the point at
which the fireworks are to
be discharged, the fallout
area based on 100 feet
per inch of shell size, the
location of all buildings,
roads, and other means of
transportation, the lines
behind which the audi-
ence will be restrained, the
location of all nearby trees,
telegraph or telephone
line, or other overhead ob-
structions shall be
provided to OCFA.
44-A new Section
5701.1.1 is added to
read:

Section 5701.1.1 Mobile
fueling. On-demand mo-
bile fueling of Class I, I,
and Il liquids into the fuel
tanks of vehicles is prohib-
ited.

45-Section 5801.1 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

Section 5801.1 Scope.
The storage and use of
flammable gases and
flammable cryogenic flu-
ids shall be in accordance
with this chapter, NFPA 2
and NFPA 55. Com-
pressed gases shall also
comply with Chapter 53
and cryogenic fluids shall
also comply with Chapter
55. Flammable cryogenic
fluids shall comply with
Section 5806. Hydrogen
motor fuel-dispensing sta-
tions and repair garages
and their associated
above-ground hydrogen
storage systems shall also
be designed, constructed
and maintained in accord-
ance with Chapter 23.
Mobile fueling of hydro-
gen-fueled vehicles shall
comply with Section 5809.
Mobile fueling of gaseous
and liquid hydrogen, com-
pressed natural gas
(CNG), and liquefied nat-
ural gas (LNG) into the
fuel tanks of vehicles is
prohibited. Exceptions:
1. Gases used as refriger-
ants in refrigeration sys-
tems (see Section 605).
2. Liquefied petroleum
gases and natural gases
regulated by Chapter 61.
3. Fuel-gas systems and
appliances regulated un-
der the California Mechan-
ical Code andthe Califor-
nia Plumbing Code other
than gaseous hydrogen
systems and appliances.
4. Pyrophoric gases in ac-
cordance with Chapter 64.
46-NFPA 13, 2016 Edi-
tion, Standard for the In-
stallation of Sprinkler
Systems Section 6.7.3 is
amended in its entirety to
read: 6.7.3 Fire depart-
ment connections (FDC)
shall be of an approved
type. The location shall be
approved and be no more
than 150 feet from a pub-
lic hydrant. The FDC may
be located within 150 feet
of a private fire hydrant
when approved by the fire
code official. The size of
piping and the number of
2%” inlets shall be ap-
proved by the fire code of-
ficial. If acceptable to the
water authority, it may be
installed on the backflow
assembly. Fire depart-



24

SUN NEWSPAPERS

Thursday, Nov. 21, 2019

PUBLIC NOTICES

714.530.7622 * legals@sunnews.org

Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB

Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB

ment inlet connections
shall be painted OSHA
safety red or as approved.
When the fire sprinkler
density design requires
more than 500 gpm (in-
cluding inside hose stream
demand), or a standpipe
system is included, four
2%” inlets shall be
provided.

47-NFPA 13, 2016 Edi-
tion, Standard for the In-
stallation of Sprinkler
Systems Section 8.3.3.1
is amended in its en-
tirety to read:

8.3.3.1 When fire sprinkler
systems are installed in
shell buildings of undeter-
mined use (Spec Build-
ings) other than ware-
houses (S occupancies),
fire sprinklers of the quick-
response type shall be
used. Use is considered
undetermined if a specific
tenant/occupant is not
identified at the time the
fire sprinkler plan is sub-
mitted. Sprinklers in light
hazard occupancies shall
be one of the following:
1-Quick-response type as
defined in 3.6.4.8
2-Residential sprinklers in
accordance with the re-
quirements of 8.4.5
3-Quick response CMSA
sprinklers

4-ESFR sprinklers
5-Standard-response
sprinklers used for modific-
ations or additions to exist-
ing light hazard systems
equipped with standard-re-
sponse sprinklers
6-Standard-response
sprinklers used where indi-
vidual standard-response
sprinklers are replaced in
existing light hazard sys-
tems

48-NFPA 13, 2016 Edi-
tion, Standard for the In-
stallation of Sprinkler
Systems Section
8.15.1.2.7 is amended in
its entirety to read:
8.15.1.2.7 Concealed
spaces filled with noncom-
bustible insulation shall not
require sprinkler protec-
tion when approved by fire
code official.

49-NFPA 13, 2016 Edi-
tion, Standard for the In-
stallation of Sprinkler
Systems A new Section
11.1.1.1 is added to read:
11.1.1.1 When fire sprink-
ler systems are required in
buildings of undetermined
use other than ware-
houses, they shall be de-
signed and installed to
have a fire sprinkler dens-
ity of not less than that re-
quired for an Ordinary
Hazard Group 2 use, with
no reduction(s) in density
or design area. Ware-
house fire sprinkler sys-
tems shall be designed to
Figure 16.2.1.3.2 (d) curve
“G”. Use is considered un-
determined if a specific
tenant/occupant is not
identified at the time the
sprinkler plan is submitted.
Where a subsequent use
or occupancy requires a
system with greater cap-
ability, it shall be the re-
sponsibility of the occu-
pant to upgrade the sys-
tem to the required dens-
ity for the new use or oc-
cupancy.

50-NFPA 13, 2016 Edi-
tion, Standard for the In-
stallation of Sprinkler
Systems A new Section
11.2.3.1.1.1 is added to
read:

11.2.3.1.1.1 The available
water supply for fire
sprinkler system design
shall be determined by
one of the following meth-
ods, as approved by the
fire code official:
1-Subtract the project site
elevation from the low wa-
ter level for the appropri-
ate pressure zone and
multiply the result by
0.433;

2-Use a maximum of 40
psi, if available;
3-Utilize the OCFA water-
flow test form/directions to
document a flow test con-

ducted by the local water
agency or an approved
third party licensed in the
State of California.
51-NFPA 13D 2016 Edi-
tion, Standard for the In-
stallation of Sprinkler
Systems in One- and
Two-Family Dwellings
and Manufactured
Homes Section 7.1.2 is
amended in its entirety
to read:

7.1.2 The sprinkler sys-
tem piping shall not have
separate control valves in-
stalled unless supervised
by a central station, propri-
etary, or remote station
alarm service.
52-NFPA 14, 2013 Edi-
tion, Installation of
Standpipe and Hose
Systems Section 7.3.1.1
is amended in its en-
tirety to read:

7.3.1.1 Class | and Ill
Standpipe hose connec-
tions shall be unobstruc-
ted and shall be located
not less than 18 inches or
more than 24 inches
above the finished floor.
Class Il Standpipe hose
connections shall be unob-
structed and shall be loc-
ated not less than 3 feet or
more than 5 feet above the
finished floor.

53-NFPA 24, 2016 Edi-
tion, Standard for the In-
stallation of Private Fire
Service Mains and Their
Appurtenances a new
Section 6.2.8.1 is added
to read:

6.2.8.1 All indicating
valves controlling fire sup-
pression water supplies
shall be painted OSHA
red. Exceptions:

1. Brass or bronze valves
on sprinkler risers moun-
ted to the exterior of the
building may be left un-
painted.

2. Where OS&Y valves on
the detector check as-
sembly are the only con-
trol valves, at least one
OS&Y valve shall be
painted red.

54-NFPA 24, 2016 Edi-
tion, Standard for the In-
stallation of Private Fire
Service Mains and Their
Appurtenances Section
6.2.9 amended in its en-
tirety to read:

Section 6.2.9 All connec-
tions to private fire service
mains for fire protection
systems shall be arranged
in accordance with one of
the following so that they
can be isolated:

1. A post indicator valve
installed not less than 40 ft
(12 m) from the building
(a) For buildings less than
40 ft (12 m) in height, a
post indicator valve shall
be permitted to be in-
stalled closer than 40 ft
(12 m) but at least as far
from the building as the
height of the wall facing
the post indicator valve.
2. A wall post indicator
valve

3.An indicating valve in a
pit, installed in accord-
ance with Section 6.4
4. A backflow preventer
with at least one indicat-
ing valve not less than 40
ft (12 m) from the building
(a) For buildings less than
40 ft (12 m) in height, a
backflow preventer with at
least one indicating valve
shall be permitted to be in-
stalled closer than 40 ft
(12 m) but at least as far
from the building as the
height of the wall facing
the backflow preventer.
5. Control valves installed
in a fire-rated room ac-
cessible from the exterior
6.Control valves in a fire-
rated stair enclosure ac-
cessible from the exterior
55-NFPA 24, 2016 Edi-
tion, Standard for the In-
stallation of Private Fire
Service Mains and Their
Appurtenances A new
Section 10.1.5 is added
to read:

10.1.5 All ferrous pipe and
joints shall be polyethyl-
ene encased per AWWA

C150, Method A, B, or C.
All fittings shall be protec-
ted with a loose 8-mil poly-
ethylene tube or sheet.
The ends of the tube or
sheet shall extend past the
joint by a minimum of 12
inches and be sealed with
2-inch-wide tape ap-
proved for underground
use. Galvanizing does not
meet the requirements of
this section.

Exception: 304 or 316
Stainless Steel pipe and
fittings

56-NFPA 24, 2016 Edi-
tion, Standard for the In-
stallation of Private Fire
Service Mains and Their
Appurtenances Section
10.4.1.1 is amended in
its entirety to read:
10.4.1.1 All bolted joint ac-
cessories shall be cleaned
and thoroughly coated with
asphalt or other corrosion-
retarding material after in-
stallation. Exception:
Bolted joint accessories
made from 304 or 316
stainless steel.
57-NFPA 24, 2016 Edi-
tion, Standard for the In-
stallation of Private Fire
Service Mains and Their
Appurtenances a new
Section 10.4.1.1.1 is ad-
ded to read:

10.4.1.1.1 All bolts used in
pipe-joint assembly shall
be 316 stainless steel.
58-NFPA 24, 2016 Edi-
tion, Standard for the In-
stallation of Private Fire
Service Mains and Their
Appurtenances Section
10.4.3.2 is amended in
its entirety to read:
10.4.3.2 Where fire ser-
vice mains enter the build-
ing adjacent to the founda-
tion, the pipe may run un-
der a building to a maxim-
um of 24 inches, as meas-
ured from the interior face
of the exterior wall to the
center of the vertical pipe.
The pipe under the build-
ing or building foundation
shall be 304 or 316 stain-
less steel and shall not
contain mechanical joints
or it shall comply with
10.4.3.2.1 through
10.4.3.2.4.
9.60.020.070 EFFECT OF
ADOPTION

The adoption of the City
Building, Residential, Elec-
trical, Mechanical, Plumb-
ing, Fire Code and the re-
peal, addition or amend-
ment of ordinances by this
code shall not affect the
following matters:

(A) Actions and pro-
ceedings which began the
effective date of this code.

(B) Prosecution for or-
dinance violations commit-
ted before the effective
date of this code.

(C) Licenses and pen-
alties due and unpaid at
the effective date of this
code, and the collection of
these licenses and penal-
ties.

(D) Bonds and cash de-
posits required to be pos-
ted, filed or deposited pur-
suant to any ordinance.

(E) Matters of record
which refer to or are con-
nected with ordinances the
substances of which are
included in this code;
these references shall be
construed to apply to the
corresponding provisions
of the code.
9.60.020.080 PENALTY;
VIOLATIONS
(A) General penalty; con-
tinuing violations. Every
act prohibited or declared
unlawful and every failure
to perform an act required
by this code is a misde-
meanor or an infraction as
set forth in the said re-
spective pertinent sec-
tions of this code and any
person causing or permit-
ting a violation of any such
section of said code shall
be subject to the penalties
ascribed to each such sec-
tion as set forth herein.

(B) Violations including
aiding, abetting, and con-
cealing. Every person

who causes, aids, abets or
conceals the fact of a viol-
ation of this code is guilty
of violating this code.

(C) Enforcement by
civil action. In addition to
the penalties provided
herein, the said code may
be enforced by civil action.
Any condition existing in
violation of this code is a
public nuisance and may
be summarily abated by
the city.

9.60.040 Pool and Spa
Code

9.60.040.010 INTERNA-
TIONAL SWIMMING
POOL AND SPA CODE
ADOPTED BY REFER-
ENCE AND AMENDED.
9.60.040.010.10 INTER-
NATIONAL SWIMMING
POOL AND SPA CODE
ADOPTED BY REFER-
ENCE

(A) 2018 International
Swimming Pool and Spa
Code as published by In-
ternational Code Council,
is hereby adopted by refer-
ence pursuant to the provi-
sions of Sections 50022.1
through 50022.10 of the
Government Code of the
State of California as
though fully set forth
herein, and made a part of
the City of Seal Beach Mu-
nicipal Code with the same
force and effect as though
set out herein in full, in-
cluding all of the regula-
tions, revisions, conditions
and terms contained
therein except that those
certain sections thereof
which are necessary to
meet local conditions as
hereinafter set forth in
Section 9.60.040.020 of
this Code are hereby re-
pealed, added or amended
to read as set forth therein.
The administration of the
International Swimming
Pool and Spa Code shall
be as set forth in Section
9.60.010 of this Code. (B)
Not less than one copy of
said 2018 International
Swimming Pool and Spa
Code together with any
and all amendments
thereto proposed by the
City of Seal Beach, has
been and is now filed in
the office of the Com-
munity Development De-
partment and shall be re-
main on file with Building
Official, and shall collect-
ively be known as the City
of Seal Beach Swimming
Pool and Spa Code and
may be cited as Section
9.60.040.010 of the Seal
Beach Municipal Code.
9.60.040.010.20 INTER-
NATIONAL SWIMMING
POOL AND SPA CODE
AMENDED

1. Chapter 1 is deleted in
its entirety.

2. Chapter 2 the follow-
ing definitions added to
read:

In addition to the defini-
tions specified in Chapter
2 Section 202 of this
Code, the following cer-
tain terms, phrases, words
and their derivatives shall
be construed as specified
in this section.

1. Where the term
International Building
Code is used it shall be re-
placed with the term Cali-
fornia Building Code.

2. Where the term
International Residential
Code is used it shall be re-
placed with the term Cali-
fornia Residential Code.

3. Where the term
International Plumbing
Code is used it shall be re-
placed with the term Cali-
fornia Plumbing Code.

4. Where the term
International Energy Con-
servation Code is used it
shall be replaced with the
term California Energy
Code.

5. Where the term
International Fire Code is
used it shall be replaced
with the term California
Fire Code.

6. Where the term
International Fuel Gas

Code is used it shall be re-
placed with the term Cali-
fornia Plumbing Code.

7. Where the term
International Mechanical
Code is used it shall be re-
placed with the term Cali-
fornia Mechanical Code.

8. Where the term
NFPA 70 is used it shall
be replaced with the term
California Electrical Code.
Section 3. Severability.
If any section, subsection,
sentence, clause, phrase
or portion of this Ordin-
ance is for any reason
held out to be invalid or
unconstitutional by the de-
cision of any court of com-
petent jurisdiction, such
decision will not affect the
validity of the remaining
portions of this ordinance.
The City Council of the
City of Seal Beach hereby
declares that it would have
adopted this ordinance
and each section, subsec-
tion, sentence, clause,
phrase or portion thereof
irrespective of the fact that
any one or more sections,
subsection, sentence
clause, phrases or por-
tions be declared valid or
unconstitutionally.
Section 4. Continuity.
To the extent the provi-
sions of this Ordinance are
substantially the same as
previous provisions of the
Seal Beach Municipal
Code, these provisions will
be construed as continu-
ations of those provisions
and not as amendments of
the earlier provisions.
Section 5. Intent to Com-
ply with Laws. The City
Council intends this Ordin-
ance to supplement, not to
duplicate or contradict, ap-
plicable state and federal
law and this Ordinance will
be construed in light of
that intent.

Section 6. Severability. If
any section, subsection,
sentence, clause, or
phrase of this ordinance is
for any reason held to be
invalid or unconstitutional
by a decision of any court
of competent jurisdiction,
such decision will not af-
fect the validity of the re-
maining portions of this or-
dinance. The City Council
hereby declares that it
would have passed this or-
dinance and each and
every section, subsection,
sentence, clause, or
phrase not declared inval-
id or unconstitutional
without regard to whether
any portion of the ordin-
ance would be sub-
sequently declared invalid
or unconstitutional.
Section 7. Publication.
The City Clerk is directed
to cause this ordinance to
be published in the man-
ner required by law.
Section 8. Effective Date.
This Ordinance will take
effect on January 1st,
2020.

PASSED, APPROVED
AND ADOPTED by the
Seal Beach City Council at
a regular meeting held on
the 12th day of November
2019.

ATTACHMENT A
LOCAL AMENDMENT
FINDINGS
LOCAL AMENDMENT

FINDINGS

I. Climatic Conditions

A. Orange County is loc-
ated in a semi-arid Medi-
terranean type climate. It
annually experiences ex-
tended periods of high
temperatures with little or
no precipitation. Hot, dry
(Santa Ana) winds, which
may reach speeds of 70
M.P.H. or greater, are also
common to the area.
These climatic conditions
cause extreme drying of
vegetation and common
building materials. Fre-
quent periods of drought
and low humidity add to
the fire danger. This pre-
disposes the area to large
destructive fires (conflag-
ration). In addition to dir-

ectly damaging or destroy-
ing buildings, these fires
are also prone to disrupt
utility services throughout
the County. Obstacles
generated by a strong
wind, such as fallen trees,
street lights and utility
poles will greatly impact
the response time to reach
an incident scene.

B. The climate alternates
between extended peri-
ods of drought and brief
flooding conditions. Flood
conditions may affect the
Orange County fire Au-
thority’s ability to respond
to a fire or emergency con-
dition. Floods also disrupt
utility services to buildings
and facilities within the
County.

C. Water demand in this
densely populated area far
exceeds the quantity sup-
plied by natural precipita-
tion; and although the pop-
ulation continues to grow,
the already-taxed water
supply does not. Califor-
nia is projected to in-
crease in population by
nearly 10 million over the
next quarter of a century
with 50 percent of that
growth centered in South-
ern California. Due to
storage capacities and
consumption, and a lim-
ited amount of rainfall fu-
ture water allocation is not
fully dependable. This ne-
cessitates the need for ad-
ditional and on-site fire
protection features.

D. These dry climatic con-
ditions and winds contrib-
ute to the rapid spread of
even small fires originat-
ing in high-density hous-
ing or vegetation. These
fires spread very quickly
and create a need for in-
creased levels of fire pro-
tection. The added protec-
tion of fire sprinkler sys-
tems and other fire protec-
tion features will supple-
ment normal fire depart-
ment response by provid-
ing immediate protection
for the building occupants
and by containing and
controlling the fire spread
to the area of origin. Fire
sprinkler systems will also
reduce the use of water for
firefighting by as much as
50 to 75 percent.

Il. Topographical condi-
tions

A. Natural; slopes of 15
percent or greater gener-
ally occur throughout the
foothills of Orange County.
The elevation change
caused by the hills cre-
ates the geological found-
ation on which communit-
ies with Orange County is
built and will continue to
build. With much of the
populated flatlands already
built upon, future growth
will occur on steeper
slopes and with greater
constraints in terrain.
B. Traffic and circulation
congestion is an artificially
created, obstructive topo-
graphical condition, which
is common throughout Or-
ange County.

C. These topographical
conditions combine to cre-
ate a situation that places
fire department response
time to fire occurrences at
risk and makes it neces-
sary to provide automatic
on-site fire-extinguishing
systems and other protec-
tion measures to protect
occupants and property.
lll. Geological Conditions
The Orange County re-
gion is a densely popu-
lated area that has build-
ings constructed over and
near a vast and complex
network of faults that are
believed to be capable of
producing future earth-
quakes similar or greater
in size than the 1994
Northridge and the 1971
Sylmar earthquakes.
Earthquake faults run
along the northeast and
southwest boundaries of

Orange County. The New-
port-Inglewood Fault, loc-
ated within Orange County
was the source of the de-
structive 1933 Long Beach
earthquake (6.3 mag-
nitude) which took 120
lives and damaged build-
ings in an area from La-
guna Beach to Marina Del
Rey to Whittier. In
December 1989, another
earthquake occurred in the
jurisdiction of Irvine at an
unknown fault line. Re-
gional planning for reoc-
currence of earthquakes is
recommended by the state
of California, Department
of Conservation.

A. Previous earthquakes
have been accompanied
by disruption of traffic flow
and fires. A severe seis-
mic event has the poten-
tial to negatively impact
any rescue or fire suppres-
sion activities because it is
likely to create obstacles
similar to those indicated
under the high wind sec-
tion above. The October
17, 1989, Santa Cruz
earthquake resulted in one
major fire in the Marina
District (San Francisco).
When combined with the
34 other fires locally and
over 500 responses, the
department was taxed to
its fullest capabilities. The
Marina fire was difficult to
contain because mains
supplying water to the dis-
trict burst during the earth-
quake. This situation cre-
ates the need for both ad-
ditional fire protection and
automatic on-site fire pro-
tection for building occu-
pants. State Department
of Conservation noted in
their 1988 report (Plan-
ning Scenario on a Major
Earthquake on the New-
port-Inglewood Fault Zone,
page 59), “unfortunately,
barely meeting the minim-
um earthquake standards
of building codes places a
building on the verge of
being legally unsafe.”
B. Road circulation fea-
tures located throughout
the County also make
amendments reasonably
necessary. Located
through the County are
major roadways, high-
ways and flood control
channels that create barri-
ers and slow response
times. Hills, slopes, street
and storm drain design,
accompanied by occasion-
al heavy rainfall, causes
roadway flooding and
landslides and at times
may make an emergency
access route impassable.
There are areas in Or-
ange County that naturally
have extended emer-
gency response times that
exceed the 5-minute goal.
C. Soils throughout the
County possess corrosive
properties that reduce the
expected usable life of wa-
ter services when metallic
pipes are in contact with
soils. Due to the topo-
graphical conditions of
sprawling development
separated by waterways
and narrow and conges-
ted streets and the expec-
ted infrastructure damage
inherent in seismic zones
described above, it is
prudent to rely on auto-
matic fire sprinkler sys-
tems to mitigate extended
fire department response
time and keep fires man-
ageable with reduced fire
flow (water) resources
available for a given struc-
ture. Additional fire pro-
tection is also justified to
match the current re-
sources of firefighting
equipment and personnel
within the Orange County
Fire Authority.

2019 California Building
Code Amendment Find-
ings Legend

CODE SECTION TITLE
(Clarification) FINDINGS
Chapter 1 Division Il Ad-
ministration Administrative



Thursday, Nov. 21, 2019

SUN NEWSPAPERS

25

PUBLIC NOTICES

714.530.7622 * legals@sunnews.org

Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB

Legals-SB Legals-SB Legals-SB

Chapter 9 Fire Protection
Systems |, Il & 11l

2019 California Residen-
tial Code Amendment
Findings Legend
CODE SECTION TITLE
(Clarification) FINDINGS
R301.1.1.3.2 Wood Frame
Structures llI

R313 Automatic Fire
Sprinkler System |, Il & IlI
2019 California Fire Code
Amendment Findings Le-
gend

CODE SECTION TITLE
(Clarification) FINDINGS
110.4 Violation penalties
Administrative

110.4.2 Infraction & Misde-
meanor Administrative
202 General definitions
Administrative

304.1.2 OCFA Vegetation
Management |

305.6 Hazardous condi-
tions | & Il

305.7 Disposal of rubbish |
&l

307.6 Fire Pits, Fire Rings,
& Outdoor Fireplaces Ad-
ministrative

307.6.1 Gas-fueled
devices | & |1l
307.6.2 Devices using
wood or fuels other than
natural gas or LPG | & Il
307.6.2.1 Where prohib-
ited | & Il

308.1.6.3 Sky lanterns | &
Il

309.2.1 Indoor charging of
electric cars Administrative
321 Fuel modification re-
quirements for new con-
struction |

322 Clearance of brush or
vegetation growth from
roadways |

323 Unusual circum-
stances Administrative
324 Use of equipment |
324.1 Use of Equipment
and Devices Generating
Heat, Sparks or Open
Flames |

324.2 Sky Lanterns or sim-
ilar devices | & Il

407.5 Hazardous material
inventory statement | & Il
501.1 Scope Administrat-
ive, I, Il &1l

510.1 Emergency respon-
der radio coverage Admin-
istrative

510.2 Emergency respon-
der radio coverage in ex-
isting buildings
Administrative

510.3 Permit required Ad-
ministrative

903.2 Where required
(Sprinklers) I, Il & Il
903.2.8 Group R (Sprink-
lers) I, 11 & Il

903.3.5.3 Hydraulically
calculated systems | & Il
1201.1.1 Other Systems
Administrative

2801.2 Permit Administrat-
ive

2808.2 Storage site Ad-
ministrative

2808.3 Size of piles |
2808.4 Pile separation |
2808.7 Pile fire protection |
2808.9 Material-handling
equipment |

2808.11 Temperature con-
trol |

2808.11.1 Pile temperat-
ure control |

2808.11.2 New material
temperature control |
2808.12 Water availability
for piles |

2808.13 Tipping area |
2808.14 Emergency con-
tact Administrative
4906.3 OCFA Vegetation
Management Guideline |
4908 Fuel modification re-
quirements for new con-
struction |

5001.5.2 Hazardous ma-
terials inventory statement
Administrative

5003.1.1.1 Extremely haz-
ardous substances | & 111
5608.2 Retail fireworks
Administrative

5608.3 Application for per-
mit Administrative
5701.1.1 On-Demand Mo-
bile fueling Administrative,
11 & 111

Chapter 80 Reference
Standards N/A

2016 NFPA 13 (Sprinkler
Systems)

Administrative, Il & IlI
2016 NFPA 13-D (Single
rgnrlily Sprinkler Systems)

2013 NFPA 14 (Standpipe
Systems) Administrative
2016 NFPA 24 (Under-
ground Water Supply Sys-
tems) Administrative & Il
Seal Beach Sun
11/21/2019 - 89894

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 2019-6558455
FOR THE MUSIC, 2243 N
Baker, Santa Ana, CA
92706. County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
Registrant(s): Joseph La-
guna, 2243 N Baker,
Santa Ana, CA 92706 and
Stewart Bower, 1
Riveroaks, Irvine, CA
92602. This business is
conducted by Copartners.
Have you started doing
business yet? NO. Regis-
trant(s): /s/ Stewart Bower.
| declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
ange County on OCTO-

BER 25, 2019.
Seal Beach Sun
10/31, 11/7,14,21/2019 -
89068

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE'S
SALE Trustee Sale No.
147147 Title No. 02-
19030878 NOTE: THERE
IS A SUMMARY OF THE
INFORMATION IN THIS
DOCUMENT ATTACHED
YOU ARE IN DEFAULT
UNDER A DEED OF
TRUST, DATED
04/25/2018. UNLESS
YOU TAKE ACTION TO
PROTECT YOUR PROP-
ERTY, IT MAY BE SOLD
AT A PUBLIC SALE. IF
YOU NEED AN EXPLAN-
ATION OF THE NATURE
OF THE PROCEEDING
AGAINST YOU, YOU
SHOULD CONTACT A
LAWYER. On 12/16/2019
at 9:00 AM, The Mortgage
Law Firm, PLC, as duly
appointed Trustee under
and pursuant to Deed of
Trust recorded
05/01/2018, as Instrument
No. 2018000156028, in
book xx, page xx, of Offi-
cial Records in the office
of the County Recorder of
Orange County, State of
California, executed by
Kalani Green A Widower,
WILL SELL AT PUBLIC
AUCTION TO HIGHEST
BIDDER FOR CASH,
CASHIER?"'S
CHECK/CASH EQUIVAL-
ENT or other form of pay-
ment authorized by
2924h(b), (payable at time
of sale in lawful money of
the United States),
Doubletree by Hilton Hotel
Anaheim - Orange County,
100 The City Drive, Or-
ange, CA 92868 -
Auction.com Room. All
right, title and interest con-
veyed to and now held by
it under said Deed of Trust
in the property situated in
said County and State, de-
scribed as: FULLY DE-
SCRIBED IN THE ABOVE
DEED OF TRUST. APN
936-29-134 The street ad-
dress and other common
designation, if any, of the
real property described
above is purported to be:
16411 Martin Ln Unit 244,
Huntington Beach, CA
92649 The undersigned
Trustee disclaims any liab-
ility for any incorrectness
of the street address and
other common designa-
tion, if any, shown herein.
Said sale will be made, but
without covenant or war-
ranty, expressed or im-
plied, regarding title, pos-
session, or encumbrances,
to pay the remaining prin-
cipal sum of the note(s)
secured by said Deed of
Trust, with interest there-
on, as provided in said
note(s), advances, if any,
under the terms of said
Deed of Trust, fees,

charges and expenses of
the Trustee and of the
trusts created by said
Deed of Trust. The total
amount of the unpaid bal-
ance of the obligation se-
cured by the property to be
sold and reasonable es-
timated costs, expenses
and advances at the time
of the initial publication of
the Notice of Sale is:
$221,462.62 If the Trust-
ee is unable to convey title
for any reason, the suc-
cessful bidder's sole and
exclusive remedy shall be
the return of monies paid
to the Trustee, and the
successful bidder shall
have no further recourse.
The beneficiary under said
Deed of Trust heretofore
executed and delivered to
the undersigned a written
Declaration of Default and
Demand for Sale, and writ-
ten Notice of Default and
Election to Sell. The un-
dersigned caused a No-
tice of Default and Elec-
tion to Sell to be recorded
in the county where the
real property is located.
Dated: 11/14/2019 THE
MORTGAGE LAW FIRM,
PLC The Mortgage Law
Firm, PLC. may be at-
tempting to collect a debt.
Any information obtained
may be used for that pur-
pose. 27455 Tierra Alta
Way, Ste. B, Temecula,
CA 92590 (619) 465-8200
FOR TRUSTEE'S SALE
INFORMATION PLEASE
CALL (800) 280-2832
NOTICE TO POTENTIAL
BIDDERS: If you are con-
sidering bidding on this
property lien, you should
understand that there are
risks involved in bidding at
a trustee auction. You will
be bidding on a lien, not
on the property itself. Pla-
cing the highest bid at a
trustee auction does not
automatically entitle you to
free and clear ownership
of the property. You
should also be aware that
the lien being auctioned off
may be a junior lien. If you
are the highest bidder at
the auction, you are or
may be responsible for
paying off all liens senior
to the lien being auctioned
off, before you can re-
ceive clear title to the
property. You are encour-
aged to investigate the ex-
istence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens that
may exist on this property
by contacting the county
recorder's office or a title
insurance company, either
of which may charge you a
fee for this information. If
you consult either of these
resources, you should be
aware that the same
lender may hold more than
one mortgage or deed of
trust on the property. NO-
TICE TO PROPERTY
OWNER: The sale date
shown on this notice of
sale may be postponed
one or more times by the
mortgagee, beneficiary,
trustee, or a court, pursu-
ant to Section 29249 of the
California Civil Code. The
law requires that informa-
tion about trustee sale
postponements be made
available to you and to the
public, as a courtesy to
those not present at the
sale. If you wish to learn
whether your sale date
has been postponed, and,
if applicable, the resched-
uled time and date for the
sale of this property, you
may call (800) 280-2832
for information regarding
the trustee's sale or visit
this Internet Web site -
www.Auction.com - for in-
formation regarding the
sale of this property, using
the file number assigned
to this case: 147147. In-
formation about postpone-
ments that are very short
in duration or that occur
close in time to the sched-
uled sale may not immedi-
ately be reflected in the

telephone information or
on the Internet Web site.
The best way to verify
postponement information
is to attend the scheduled
sale. A-4710774
11/21/2019, 11/28/2019,
12/05/2019

Huntington Harbour

Sun-Journal
11/21,28, 12/5/2019 -
89931

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 2019-6558442
SECRETEA, 2009 W.
Commonwealth Ave. #H,
Fullerton, CA 92833.
County: Orange. This is a
New Statement. Regis-
trant(s): Secretea America
Inc., 2009 W. Common-
wealth Ave. #H, Fullerton,
CA 92833. This business
is conducted by a Corpor-
ation. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
Registrant(s): /s/ Hui Ning
Chou Chief Executive Of-
ficer. | declare that all in-
formation in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
Orange County on OCTO-

BER 25, 2019.
Seal Beach Sun
10/31,11/7,14,21/2019 -
89064

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 2019-6558471
MICRO-CABLES, 375
Cliffwood Park St. Unit D,
Brea, CA 92821. County:
Orange. This is a New
Statement. Registrant(s):
New Experimental Tech-
nologies, 375 Cliffwood
Park St, Unit D, Brea, CA
92821. This business is
conducted by a Corpora-
tion. Have you started do-
ing business yet? NO. Re-
gistrant(s): /s/ Joe Benson
Chief Executive Officer. |
declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is
true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true
information which he or
she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Or-
ange County on OCTO-

BER 25, 2019.
Seal Beach Sun
11/7,14,21,28/2019 -
89480

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.

30-2019-01109695
TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Petitioner:
DENISE ISABELLE
STOLZ and KEVIN
SONGCHOL PARK on be-
half of ISABELLA KATH-
ARINA PARK and KATAR-
INA ANELIESE PARK,
MINORS, filed a petition
with this court for a de-
cree changing names as
follows: ISABELLA KATH-
ARINA PARK to ISA-
BELLA KATHARINA
PARK-STOLZ and
KATARINA ANELIESE
PARK to KATARINA ANE-
LIESE PARK-STOLZ. THE
COURT ORDERS that all
persons interested in this
matter shall appear before
this court at the hearing in-
dicated below to show
cause, if any, why the peti-
tion for change of name
should not be granted. Any
person objecting to the
name changes described
above must file a written
objection that includes the
reasons for the objection
at least two court days be-
fore the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and must
appear at the hearing to
show cause why the peti-
tion should not be granted.
If no written objection is
timely filed, the court may
grant the petition without a

hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING

January 9, 2020
8:30 a.m., Dept. D100
Window 44
Superior Court

700 Civic Center Dr. W.

Santa Ana, CA 92701
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be pub-
lished at least once each
week for four successive
weeks prior to the date set
for hearing on the petition
in the following:
Seal Beach Sun
DATE: November 5, 2019
JAMES J. DI CESARE
Judge of the
Superior Court

Seal Beach Sun
11/21, 28 12/5,12/2019 -
89955

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 2019-6559603
OMPICK, 8232 Pawtucket
Drive, Huntington Beach,
CA 92646. County: Or-
ange. This is a Change
Statement. Registrant(s):
Danielle Scane, 8232
Pawtucket Dr, Huntington
Beach, CA 92646. This
business is conducted by
An Individual. Have you
started doing business
yet? YES 08/01/2018. Re-
gistrant(s): /s/ Danielle
Scane. | declare that all in-
formation in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
Orange County on
NOVEMBER 8, 2019.
Seal Beach Sun
11/21,28 12/5,12//2019 -
89956

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
OF

BULK SALE

(UCC SEC. 6105)
Escrow No. 12-10464-DH
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIV-
EN that a bulk sale is
about to be made. The
name(s), business ad-
dress(es) of the Seller(s),
are:
Pablo Antonio Benavente
and Lauren Benavente
6078 Warner Avenue,
Huntington Beach, CA
92647
Doing Business as: Se-
bastiani's Italian Bistro
(Type - Restaurant)
All other business name(s)
and address(es) used by
the Seller(s) within the
past three years, as stated
by the Seller(s), is/are:
NONE
The location in California
of the Chief Executive Of-
ficer of the Seller(s) is:
3647 Myra Avenue, Ana-
heim, CA 92804
The name(s) and address
of the Buyer(s) is/are:
Sebastiani's Enterprises,
Inc. 5281 Hendricksen
Drive Huntington Beach,
CA 92649
The assets being sold are
described in general as:
Furniture, fixtures, equip-
ment, inventory and liquor
license and are located at:
6078 Warner Avenue,
Huntington Beach, CA
92647
The bulk sale is intended
to be consummated at the
office of: Prominent Es-
crow Services, Inc., 18446
Brookhurst Street Foun-
tain Valley, CA 92708 and
the anticipated sale date is
12/11/19
The bulk sale is subject to
California Uniform Com-
mercial Code Section
6106.2 YES/NO YES
The name and address of
the person with whom
claims may be filed is:
Prominent Escrow Ser-
vices, Inc., 18446
Brookhurst Street Foun-
tain Valley, CA 92708
(STTN: D. Holmes / Esc
12-10464-DH) and the last
date for filing claims by
any creditor shall be
12/10/19, which is the

business day before the

sale date specified above.

Dated: 11-12-19

Buyer(s)

Sebastiani's Enterprises,

Inc.

S/ By: Phillip Ventura,

President

11/21/19

CNS-3316249#

HUNTINGTON HAR-

BOUR SUN-JOURNAL
Huntington Harbour

Sun-Journal

11/21/2019 - 89994

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
NAME STATEMENT
NO: 2019-6558499
HUNTINGTON BEACH
COORDINATING COUN-
CIL, 5901 Liege Drive,
Huntington Beach, CA
92649. County: Orange.
This is a New Statement.
Registrant(s): Hall A.
Clement Memorial Fund
Incorporated, 5901 Liege
Drive, Huntington Beach,
CA 92649. This business
is conducted by A Corpor-
ation. Have you started
doing business yet? NO.
Registrant(s): /s/ Michael
Francis Heywood Presid-
ent. | declare that all in-
formation in this state-
ment is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares
as true information which
he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of
Orange County on OCTO-

BER 28, 2019.
Seal Beach Sun
11/7,14,21,28/2019 -
89340

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
OF BULK SALE
(UCC Sec. 6105)

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIV-

EN that a bulk sale is

about to be made. The

name(s), business ad-
dress(es) to the Seller(s),
are:

Xa Café, Inc. 18685 Main

Street, Ste 103, Hunting-

ton Beach, Ca. 92648

Doing Business as: Xa

Sweet & Savory Café

All other business name(s)

and address(es) used by

the Seller(s) within three
years, as stated by the

Seller(s), is/are: None

The name(s) and address

of the Buyer(s) is/are:

Xa Sweet & Savory Cafe

LLC, 18685 Main Street,

Suite 103, Huntington

Beach, CA 92648

The assets to be sold are

described in general as:

Fixtures, Equipment, As-

signment of Lease, Trans-

fer of Business Name and
are located at: 18685 Main

Street, Suite 103, Hunting-

ton Beach, CA 92648

The bulk sale is intended

to be consummated at the

office of: California Eagle

Escrow, Inc., 9039 Bolsa

Ave. Ste. 312, Westmin-

ster, CA 92683 and the

anticipated sale date is

12/11/19

The bulk sale is subject to

California Uniform Com-

mercial Code Section

6106.2 YES

The name and address of

the person with whom

claims may be filed is:

California Eagle Escrow,

Inc. 9039 Bolsa Ave. Ste.

312, Westminster, CA

92683, Escrow No. 19-

13458-PP and the last

date for filing claims shall
be 12/10/19, which is the
business day before the
sale date specified above.

Dated: 11/13/2019

Buyer(s)

Xa Sweet & Savory Cafe

LLC

By:S/ Vy Thoai Truong,

Managing Member

By: Tien Thi Cam Nguyen,

Managing Member

11/21/19

CNS-3315930#

HUNTINGTON HAR-

BOUR SUN-JOURNAL

Huntington Harbour
Sun-Journal

11/21/2019 - 90005

NOTICE OF PUBLIC
SALE

Pursuant to the California
Self Service Storage Facil-
ity Act (B&P Code 21700
ET seq.) the undersigned
will sell at public auction
on Friday November 29,
2019 Personal Property in-
cluding but not limited to
furniture, Clothing, tools
and/or household items
located at:
Seacliff Self Storage
18100 Kovacs Lane
Huntington Beach, CA
92648 4:00 pm
Autore Jr., Umberto F.
Corral, Ruben
Maher, Robin L.
Murrietta, Ronnie,
Richardson, Kyle W.
Rohr, lan L.
Sharp, Ashley L.
Stump, David
All sales are subject to pri-
or cancellation. All terms,
rules and regulations are
available at time of sale.
Dated this 14th, of Novem-
ber and 21st of November
2019 by Seacliff Self Stor-
age, 18100 Kovacs Lane,
Huntington Beach, CA
92648 (714) 375-1700
11/14, 11/21/19
CNS-3312955#
HUNTINGTON HAR-
BOUR SUN-JOURNAL
Huntington Harbour
Sun-Journal
11/14,21/2019 - 89628

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
OF BULK SALE
(UCC Sec. 6105)

Escrow No. 30330-P0OC

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIV-

EN that a bulk sale is

about to be made. The

name(s), business ad-
dress(es) to the Seller(s)
are: SUSHI RYOKAN,

LLC, 1013 PACIFIC

COAST HIGHWAY SEAL

BEACH, CA 90740

Doing Business as: SUSHI

RYOKAN

All other business name(s)

and address(es) used by

the Seller(s) within three
years, as stated by the

Seller(s), is/are:

The location in California

of the Chief Executive Of-

ficer of the Seller(s) is:

NONE

The name(s) and address

of the Buyer(s) is/are: SAN

YUME SUSHI INC, 2737

GREENLEAF DRIVE,

WEST COVINA, CA

91792

The assets to be sold are

described in general as:

GOODWILL, LEASE-

HOLD INTEREST, IN-

VENTORY, FURNITURE,

FIXTURES AND EQUIP-

MENT and are located at:

1013 PACIFIC COAST

HIGHWAY, SEAL

BEACH, CA 90740

The bulk sale is intended

to be consummated at the

office of: CITYWIDE ES-

CROW SERVICES INC,

12501 SEAL BEACH

BLVD, STE 130, SEAL

BEACH, CA 90740 and

the anticipated sale date is

DECEMBER 11, 2019

The bulk sale is subject to

California Uniform Com-

mercial Code Section

6106.2.

[If the sale subject to Sec.

6106.2, the following in-

formation must be

provided.] The name and
address of the person with
whom claims may be filed
is: CITYWIDE ESCROW

SERVICES INC, 12501

SEAL BEACH BLVD,

STE 130, SEAL BEACH,

CA 90740 and the last day

for filing claims shall be

DECEMBER 10, 2019,

which is the business day

before the sale date spe-
cified above.

Dated: 11/19/19

BUYER: SAN YUME

SUSHI INC

LA2410803 SEAL BEACH

SUN 11/21/2019

Seal Beach Sun

11/21/2019-90035



